

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Vacant Landscaping & Property Preservation
 Maintenance for Environmental Code
 Bid No: 2017-108
 Date: August 31, 2017 2:00 p.m.

ITEM	QTY	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	Edens Touch Landscape Management		Weldon's Lawn and Tree, LLC		Jba Land Management	
				UNIT	EXTENDED	UNIT	EXTENDED	UNIT	EXTENDED
1	1	Each	Mowing, trimming/weedeating of standard vacant residential/commercial lot, priced on a per lot basis. Includes mowing, trimming/weedeating of alley or easement to the midline of said alley or easement. Includes blowing of street, alley and sidewalk onto the property. Minor trash removal shall be included with the mowing of high grass. Minor trash shall be defined as one garbage bag full.	45.00	45.00		No Bid		No Bid
2	1	Each	Mowing, trimming/weedeating of a residential lot, with structure, priced on a per lot basis. Includes mowing, trimming/weedeating of alley or easement to the midline of said alley or easement and flower beds. Includes mowing, trimming/weedeating of alley or easement to the midline of said alley or easement. Includes blowing of street, alley and sidewalk onto the property. Minor trash removal shall be included with the mowing of high grass. Minor trash shall be defined as one garbage bag full.	50.00	50.00		No Bid		No Bid
3	1	Acre	Mowing, trimming of property in excess of one (1) acre (43,560 sq. ft.), priced on a per acre basis. Includes mowing, trimming/weedeating of alley or easement to the midline of said alley or easement. Includes blowing of street, alley and sidewalk onto the property. Minor trash removal shall be included with the mowing of high grass. Minor trash shall be defined as one garbage bag full.	55.00	55.00		No Bid		No Bid
4	1	Each	The mowing, trimming/weedeating of an alley or easement to the midline of said alley or easement. Includes mowing, trimming/weedeating of alley or easement to the midline of said alley or easement. Includes blowing of street, alley and sidewalk onto the property. Minor trash removal shall be included with the mowing of high grass. Minor trash shall be defined as one garbage bag full.	30.00	30.00		No Bid		No Bid
5	1	Hour	Mowing of areas not platted into lots nor easily computed into acreage such as large easements or rights-of-way. Includes any cutting done with weed eaters. Includes blowing of street, alley and sidewalk onto the property. Price based per hour per worker. Minor trash removal shall be included with the mowing of high grass. Minor trash shall be defined as one garbage bag full.	40.00	40.00		No Bid		No Bid
6	1	Load	The hauling of trash, debris and rubbish shall be bid on a per load (6' x 16' x 4' utility trailer) basis as is to include; vehicle, machinery and disposal cost. If trash/debris is dumped in a landfill that charges a fee, an actual dump receipt must be submitted with vendor's invoice for contractor reimbursement. If trash/debris is dumped elsewhere, site must be identified and a dumping fee included in this bid.	240.00	240.00		No Bid		No Bid

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Vacant Landscaping & Property Preservation
 Maintenance for Environmental Code
 Bid No: 2017-108
 Date: August 31, 2017 2:00 p.m.

ITEM	QTY	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	Edens Touch Landscape Management		Weldon's Lawn and Tree, LLC		Jba Land Management	
				UNIT	EXTENDED	UNIT	EXTENDED	UNIT	EXTENDED
6A	1	Hour	This category shall take into consideration the cost of workers exceeding three (3) in number, per worker performing under item 6. This per ½ hour price shall be multiplied by the number of workers and added to the price in item 6. Price per worker rate per hour. Example: 5 men performing clean-up for 2 hours-2 man x 2 hrs. x 2 x item price = \$ amount to be charged or 2 man x 2 hrs. ÷ .5 x item price = \$ amount to be charged.	25.00	25.00		No Bid		No Bid
6B	1	Load	This category shall take into consideration the cost of remove on a per load (number of bags) basis and is to cover the "rake and bag" of all yard waste in excess of 12 inches. "Yard waste" is defined as leaves, grass clippings, yard and garden debris, and brush, including clean woody vegetative material not greater than six-inches in diameter, that result from landscaping maintenance and land-clearing.	240.00	240.00		No Bid		No Bid
7	1	Hour	Per hour charge for miscellaneous cleaning of trash, debris, rubbish, mowing or weedeating between rights-of-way/easements and private property lines.	33.00	33.00		No Bid		No Bid
8	1	Hour	The cutting of over-hanging tree limbs, bushes or any other vegetation that is considered an encroachment, priced on per hour basis.	50.00	50.00		No Bid		No Bid
9	1	Hour	Trimming of bushes/shrubs blocking windows and front porch and trimming of trees/bushes that are resting on roof of house. Priced on per man per hour basis.	45.00	45.00		No Bid		No Bid
10	1	Hour	Securing of open/vacant structures, i.e. open doors, and/or broken windows and shall include the cost of two (2) workers. Price per hour for two (2) workers. Material shall be priced separately and receipt or itemized list, with unit price, shall be submitted per each invoice.	111.00	111.00		No Bid		No Bid
11	1	Hour	Repair of residential/commercial fences and shall include the labor cost of two (2) workers. Price per hour for two (2) workers. Materials shall be priced separately and receipt or itemized list, with unit price, shall be submitted per each invoice.	65.00	65.00		No Bid		No Bid
12	1	Hour	Removal of residential fences and shall include the labor cost per hour per worker and the hauling off of old fence.	75.00	75.00		No Bid		No Bid
13	1	Hour	Application of Address numbers (front and/or rear of property). Price per hour and shall include materials and receipt of itemized list, with unit price, shall be submitted per each invoice.	45.00	45.00		No Bid		No Bid
14	1	Hour	Removal or covering of graffiti on residential/commercial lots. Price per hour and shall include materials and receipt or itemized list, with unit price; shall be submitted per each invoice.	60.00	60.00		No Bid		No Bid
Special Conditions, Delivery, Terms, Signature Page				Yes					
Addendum 1				No					
Addendum 2				No					
GROSS TOTAL:									
LESS DISCOUNT:									
NET TOTAL:									
TERMS:				2% 10 Calendar Days		Net 30		Net 30	
DELIVERY:				As Stated		As Stated		As Stated	