
CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title:
Bid No:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

 
1 14,653        ea. 2.69       39,416.57      2.75       40,295.75      2.99        43,812.47      
2 14,653        ea. 2.69       39,416.57      2.75       40,295.75      2.99        43,812.47      
3 178             ea. 3.56       633.68           3.95       703.10           4.25        756.50           
4 22               ea. 3.99       87.78             6.50       143.00           4.25        93.50             
5 22               ea. 2.69       59.18             3.50       77.00             2.99        65.78             

GROSS TOTAL: 79,613.78$    81,514.60$    88,540.72$    
LESS DISCOUNT: (2,656.22)
NET TOTAL: 79,613.78$    81,514.60$    85,884.50$    
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

 Annual Dry Cleaning Services for Police Department 
Uniforms 

October 6, 2016 2:00 p.m.

Stafford Cleaners Fashion Park Cleaners
Toudanines Fine Dry 

Cleaning

DESCRIPTION

Net 30 Net 30 3%, 5 Calendar Days
1 Calendar Day1 Calendar Day 1 Calendar Day

Uniform Coats
Honor Guard Jacket
Honor Guard Trouser

Dry Cleaning Bid Prices
Uniform Shirt
Uniform Trousers

2016-094
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title:
Bid No:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

1 1 ea. 8.00       8.00               No Bid 14.99      14.99             
2 1 ea. 8.00       8.00               No Bid 25.99      25.99             
3 1 ea. 8.00       8.00               No Bid 14.99      14.99             

No Bid
1 1 ea. 10.00     10.00             No Bid 10.99      10.99             
2 1 ea. 10.00     10.00             No Bid 14.99      14.99             
3 1 ea. 10.00     10.00             No Bid 14.99      14.99             

1 1 ea 20.00     20.00             No Bid 14.99      14.99             
2 1 ea 10.00     10.00             No Bid 14.99      14.99             

1 1 ea. 6.00       6.00                No Bid 8.00        8.00               

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Toudanines Fine Dry 
Cleaning

DESCRIPTION

Alteration Prices - Two-Day Service

1 Calendar Day 1 Calendar Day 1 Calendar Day
Net 30

Increase or decrease crotch seam (price per pair)

Uniform Shirts
Side seams tapers (price per seam)
Side seam and sleeve tapered (price per seam)
Side sleeve length (price per seam)

Net 30 3%, 5 Calendar Days

 Annual Dry Cleaning Services for Police Department 
Uniforms 
2016-094
October 6, 2016 2:00 p.m.

Stafford Cleaners Fashion Park Cleaners

Uniform Trousers
Shorten or lengthen leg (price per pair)

Zipper Repair
Zipper Repair on uniform shirts
Zipper Repair on uniform trousers

Patches
Sew on each patch

Increase or decrease waist (price per pair)
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title:
Bid No:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

1 1 ea. 8.00       8.00               9.00       9.00               14.99      14.99             
2 1 ea. 8.00       8.00               9.00       9.00               25.99      25.99             
3 1 ea. 8.00       8.00               9.00       9.00               14.99      14.99             

1 1 ea. 10.00     10.00             11.00     11.00             10.99      10.99             
2 1 ea. 10.00     10.00             12.00     12.00             14.99      14.99             
3 1 ea. 10.00     10.00             10.00     10.00             14.99      14.99             

1 1 ea 20.00     20.00             13.00     13.00             14.99      14.99             
2 1 ea 10.00     10.00             13.00     13.00             14.99      14.99             

1 1 ea. 6.00       6.00               6.00       6.00               8.00        8.00               

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Fashion Park Cleaners
Toudanines Fine Dry 

Cleaning

Zipper Repair on uniform trousers

Uniform Trousers
Shorten or lengthen leg (price per pair)
Increase or decrease waist (price per pair)

2016-094

Stafford Cleaners

 Annual Dry Cleaning Services for Police Department 
Uniforms 

Net 30 Net 30 3%, 5 Calendar Days
1 Calendar Day 1 Calendar Day 1 Calendar Day

Patches
Sew on each patch

Increase or decrease crotch seam (price per pair)

Zipper Repair
Zipper Repair on uniform shirts

Side seam and sleeve tapered (price per seam)
Side sleeve length (price per seam)

DESCRIPTION

Alteration Prices - Three - Five Day Service
Uniform Shirts
Side seams tapers (price per seam)

October 6, 2016 2:00 p.m.
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title:
Bid No:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

1 1                 LS  79,613.78       81,514.60       88,540.72      
1 1                 LS 90.00             No Bid 134.92           
1 1                 LS 90.00             92.00             134.92           

GROSS TOTAL: 79,793.78$    81,606.60$    88,810.56$    
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: 79,793.78$    81,606.60$    88,810.56$    
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Net 30 Net 30 3%, 5 Calendar Days
1 Calendar Day 1 Calendar Day 1 Calendar Day

Rejected Bid Rejected Bid Rejected Bid

DESCRIPTION

Dry Cleaning Bid Prices

 Annual Dry Cleaning Services for Police Department 
I015-2014
September 24, 2013 2:00 p.m.

Alteration Prices - Two-Day Service
Alteration Prices - Three - Five Day Service

Stafford Cleaners Fashion Park Cleaners
Toudanines Fine Dry 

Cleaning
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