ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MESQUITE, TEXAS,
AMENDING CHAPTER 5 OF THE CODE OF THE CITY OF
MESQUITE, TEXAS, AS AMENDED, BY DELETING ARTICLE
XIF'IN ITS ENTIRETY AND ADDING A NEW ARTICLE Xlll
THEREBY ADOPTING THE INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2015 EDITION, AND PROVIDING
CERTAIN ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS THERETO;
PROVIDING FOR A REPEALER CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR A
SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR A PENALTY
NOT TO EXCEED TWO THOUSAND ($2,000.00) DOLLARS
FOR EACH OFFENSE; AND DECLARING AN EFFECTIVE
DATE.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIDF THE CITY OF
MESQUITE, TEXAS:

SECTION 1: That Chapter 5 of the Code of the Q@ftyMesquite, Texas, as
amended, is hereby amended by deleting Article Kllts entirety and adding a new Article XIlI
to read as follows, in all other respects said Catte Chapter to remain in full force and effect:

ARTICLE XI1l1. RESIDENTIAL CODE
DIVISION 1. GENERAL
Sec. 5-467. Adopted.

Thelnternational Residential Cod@015 Edition, a publication of the InternatioQadde
Council (I.C.C.), is hereby adopted and designatethe official residential code of the City of
Mesquite to the same extent as if such code wagredoerbatim in this Article subject to the
amendments prescribed in this Article. The coddl §ie applicable to all construction, alterations,
movement, enlargement, replacement, repairs, eguipmse and occupancy, location, removal
and demolition and maintenance of detached onetvamdamily units and multiple single-family
units (townhouses) not more than three storieeight with separate means of egress and their
accessory structures. A copy of theternational Residential Co¢e2015 Edition, and
amendments thereto shall be maintained in theeoffiche City Secretary as an original document
and ordinance of the City.

DIVISION 2. AMENDMENTS
Sec. 5-468. Amendmentsto the International Residential Code, 2015 Edition.
The following amendments are made to ltiternational Residential Cod@015 Edition:

(2) Chapter 1, Scope and Administration



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017

Page 2 of 18
(a)

(b)
(€)

(d)
(e)

(f)
(9)

Section R102.4Amend by deleting the first paragraph in the isacn its
entirety and adding a new first paragraph and aemtion to Section
R102.4 to read as follows:

Referenced codes and standard$ie codes, when specifically
adopted, and standards referenced in this codélshabnsidered
part of the requirements of this code to the presdrextent of each
such reference. Whenever amendments have beeteddopthe
referenced code and standards, each referencedacade and
standard shall be considered to reference the amamd as well.
Any reference made to NFPA 70 or the ICC Electricatle shall
mean theéNational Electrical Codas adopted.

Exception: Where enforcement of a code provision would
violate the conditions of the listing of the equigmh or
appliance, the conditions of the listing and maotufeer's
instructions shall apply.

Section R104.10Amend by deleting Section R104.10 in its entirety

Section R105.2Amend by deleting ltem #s 1, 2, 3, 5, 7 and dtfSection
R105.2 in their entirety and renumber the remairtieigns appropriately.

Section R105.3.1.1Amend by deleting Section R105.3.1.1 in its eniret

Section R105.5Amend by deleting the section in its entirety addiag a
new Section R105.5 to read as follows:

Expiration. Every permit issued shall expire and become nudl an
void if (i) the permittee fails to commence work dne site
authorized by such permit within 30 days aftenssiance, or (ii)
the permittee fails to have the work authorizedtmnsite by such
permit inspected during any 90-day period after Wark has
commenced. It shall be unlawful to commence oomeoence
work after a permit expires without obtaining a npermit or
receiving an extension from the Building Officiallhe Building
Official is authorized to grant, in writing, one imore extensions of
time, for periods not more than 90 days each. kktension shall be
requested in writing and justifiable cause demaustt.

Section R106.1.4Amend by deleting Section R106.1.4 in its entirety.

Section R107.1.2Amend by adding a new Section R107.1.2 to read as
follows:

Toilet facilities required. Every construction project requiring a
building permit within the City limits of the Citgf Mesquite shall
have adequate toilet facilities for workers asdedawith the



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017

Page 3 of 18

(h)

@)

(¢))
(h)

project. At least one permanent or temporary tddeility shall be
maintained in each subdivision for the employeesutacontractors
of each builder holding a permit for a buildingtivat subdivision.

Permanent toilet facility is defined as a roomnneaisting building
or in the building being constructed with a watlset installed in
such a room, which conforms to the Plumbing Codd &n
continuously available to all workers involved incanstruction
project.

Temporary toilet facility is defined as a portalildly enclosed
chemical sanitized toilet, which is serviced areboled at least once
each week.

Section R108.2Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adding a
new Section R108.2 to read as follows:

Schedule of permit fee€On buildings, structures, electrical, gas,
mechanical and plumbing systems or alterationsiregua permit,

a fee for each permit shall be paid as requiredrbefvork is
commenced, in accordance with the schedule aslissidh by the
City of Mesquite.

Section R108.4Amend by adding an exception to Section R108 #aal
as follows:

Exception: Whenever a permit is required for a buildingusture,
electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system, aatk is
commenced without securing the applicable perrhi, Building
Official may charge double the amount of the udeal for the
permit.

Section R109.1.3Amend by deleting the section in its entirety aulding
a new Section R109.1t8 read as follows:

Floodplain inspections. For construction permitted in areas prone
to flooding as established by Table R301.2(1), uplacement of
the lowest floor including basement and prior totHar vertical
construction, the Building Official may require suoission of
documentation, prepared and sealed by a registelesign
professional, of the elevation of the lowest floancluding
basement, required in Section R322.

Section R110.1Amend by deleting Section R110.1 in its entirety.

Section R110.2Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adlding a
new Section R110.2 to read as follows:



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017
Page 4 of 18

Change in occupancy.When a rental dwelling unit is vacated by
the tenant, the owner of the unit must apply fod aeceive a
certificate of occupancy from the Building Officiatior to the unit
being reoccupied.The Building Official or his designated
representative will inspect the unit and premisasdompliance
with this code, the Property Maintenance Code dahdrapplicable
ordinances of the City. If deficiencies are foutide Building
Official may prohibit occupancy of the unit and mises until such
time as the owner takes action needed to bringniteand premises
into compliance. The inspection required by tlésti®n shall also
be required for a non-owner occupied dwelling @mtl premises
prior to its original occupancy.

1. If the dwelling unit is found to be occupied prito
inspection, the Building Official shall assess an
administrative fee of One Hundred ($100.00) Dolltrs
defray the expense to the City for conducting apéaction
of an occupied unit. Said fee shall be paid byotlveer prior
to any further inspection or reinspection of thé and shall
be cumulative of all other fees or penalties predidh this
code.

(1) Section R110.3.Amend the first paragraph in Section R110.3 txdras
follows:

Certificate issued.When the Building Official determines that a
non-owner occupied dwelling unit and premises areompliance
with the provisions of this and other applicablees, the Building
Official shall issue a certificate of occupancy toning the

following:

1. The address of the structure;

2. The name and address of the property owner;

3. A statement that the described portions of thectire have
Eggglinspected for compliance with the requiremehtkis

4, The name of the Building Official,

5. The edition of the code on which the certificateswssued;
and
6. The date the certificate of occupancy was issued.

() Section R110.3.1.Amend by adding a new Section 110.3.1 to read as
follows:



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017

Page 5 of 18

(k)

()

(m)

No certificate of occupancy shall be issued for @-owner
occupied dwelling unit until the owner has paidifected liens
of whatsoever nature attached to the propertyvarfaf the City of
Mesquite, together with interest as allowed by law.

Section R111.1Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adlding a
new Section R111.1 to read as follows:

Connection of service utilitiesNo person shall make connections
from a utility, source of energy, power or wateatty new dwelling
unit, townhouse or system regulated by this code raquiring a
permit until such connection is approved by thel@aog Official.
No person shall make connections for water utditie any non-
owner occupied dwelling unit that is required bystbode to be
inspected prior to occupancy until the unit is amed as code
compliant and the Building Official has issued atiGeate of
occupancy.

Section R111.3Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adlding a
new Section R111.3 to read as follows:

Authority to disconnect service utilitiedn case of an emergency
necessitating disconnection of utilities to elimien@an immediate
hazard to life or property, the Building Officiahal have the
authority to authorize disconnection of utility @ee to a building,
structure or system regulated by this code andefezenced codes
and standards set forth in Section R102.4. ThédBig Official
shall notify the service utility and whenever pbésithe owner and
occupant of the building, structure or service sysbf the decision
to disconnect prior to taking such action. If prnatification is not
possible, the owner or occupants of the builditrgicsure or service
system shall be notified in writing, as soon ascfical thereafter.
In addition, the Building Official shall have theuthority to
authorize disconnection of utility service to albung, structure or
system, if a building, structure or system is fotmdbe in violation
of this code, including a connection made withcwg approval
required by Sections R111.1 and R111.2, or any aitthance of
the City and after notification of the violationshbeen made to the
owner and/or occupant of the building or structamd the violation
IS not corrected.

Section R112.1Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adding a
new Section R112.1 to read as follows:

Appeals.Any person shall have the right to appeal a decisiadhe
Building Official to the Building Standards Boardtablished in



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017
Page 6 of 18

Section 5-25 according to the procedures and toneyppeal set
forth therein.

(n)  Section R114.3Amend by adding a new Section R114.3 to readlbsifs:

Construction debris.Construction debris from that work for which
a permit is required must be confined to a contamm
structure/container approved by the Building Of#ficior his
authorized representative.

(2) Chapter 2, Definitions
€)) Section R202.

1. Amend by adding a new definition of “Dwelling Unilon-Owner
Occupied” in Section R202 to read as follows:

Dwelling unit, non-owner occupiedA dwelling unit, room
or other living space in a one- or two-family dvmgj that is
not inhabited, not intended to be inhabited, by pleson
holding legal title thereto, or that is let or intked to be let
to any person unrelated to the owner. A non-owgeupied
dwelling unit shall include any unit, room or otHarng
space occupied, or intended to be occupied, purdoaa
written or verbal tenancy agreement of any durabora
contract for deed or any other contract or deetidbaveys
less than legal title to the occupant.

2. Amend by deleting the definition of "Townhouse'tire section in
its entirety and adding a new definition of “Townise” in Section
R202 to read as follows:

TownhouseA single-family unit constructed in a group of
attached units separated by property lines in wiaith unit
extends from foundation to roof and with open spaceat
least two sides.

(3) Chapter 3, Building Planning

(@) Table R301.2(1). Amend by deleting the chart in the table in n$irety
and adding a new chart to Table R301.2(1) to reddlbws:

TABLE R301.2(1)
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017

Page 7 of 18

**Table R301.2(1); fill in asfollows:

GROUND SNOW WIND DESIGN SEISMIC DESIGN
LOAD SPEED (mph) Topographic Effects CATEGORY
5 |b/f2 115 (3-sec-qust)/76 No A
E— fastest mile
SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM
Weathering Frost line depth Termite¢
moderate 6” very heavy

WINTER DESIGN
TEMP®

ICE BARRIER UNDER- FLOOD AIR FREEZING | MEAN ANNUAL
LAYMENT REQUIRED" | HAZARDS? INDEX! TEMP

22°F

No local code 69°F 64.9F

For SlI: 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kNAn10mile per hour = 1.609 km/h.

(b)

(€)

(d)

(€)

Section R302.3Amend by adding a third exception to Section R3Qa.3
read as follows:

Two-family dwelling units that are also divided hyproperty line
through the structure shall be separated as retfore¢ownhouses.

Section R302.5.1Amend by deleting the section in its entirety addiag
a new Section R302.5.1 to read as follows:

Opening protectionOpenings from a private garage directly into a
room used for sleeping purposes shall not be ptthit Other
openings between the garage and residence shetjupped with
solid wood doors not less than 1-3/8 inches (35 nmmhickness,
solid or honeycomb core steel doors not less thaf8 inches (35
mm) thick, or 20-minute fire-rated doors.

Section R302.5.2Amend by deleting the section in its entirety addiag
a new Section R302.5.2 to read as follows:

Duct penetration: Ducts in the garage and ducts penetrating the
walls or ceilings separating the dwelling from tegage shall have
no openings into the garage and shall be protexsecquired by
Section 302.11, Item 4.

Section R302.7 Amend by deleting the section in its entiretd @adding a
new Section R302.7 to read as follows:

Under-stair protection:Enclosed accessible space under stairs shall
have walls, under-stair surface and any soffitstqmted on the



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017
Page 8 of 18

enclosed side with 5/8-inch (15.8 mm) fire-rategpgiym board or
one-hour fire-resistive construction.

() Section R309.1Amend by deleting the first sentence in the sectn its
entirety and adding a new first sentence in SecR@09.1 to read as
follows:

Floor surfacesGarage floor surfaces shall be of reinforced cetecr
material designed to specifications as require@iby code.

(9) Section R309.2Amend by adding a new sentence at the end ofitste f
paragraph in Section R309.2 to read as follows:

Carport floor surfaces shall be reinforced concré¢signed to
specifications as required by City ordinance, polar other
approved surfaces as allowed by City ordinance.

(h)  Section R311.7.8.3Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adding
a new Section R311.7.8.3 to read as follows:

Handrail grip size. The handgrip portion of handrail shall have a
circular cross section of 1-1/4 inches (32 mm) mimn to 3-1/8
inch (80 mm) maximum. Other handrail shapes thavigde an
equivalent grasping surface are permissible. Edpedl have a
minimum radius of 1/8—inch (3.2 mm).

0] Section R312.1.1Amend by adding a sentence at the end of the phg
in Section R312.1.1 to read as follows:

Required guards shall not be constructed with bote rails or
other ornamental pattern that results in a ladtfecte

()] Section R319. Amend by deleting the section iantsety and adding a
new Section R319 to read as follows:

Premises identification The official house or street number
assigned to the property must be displayed atthetfront and rear
of the property. The numbers shall be in Arabacklnumerals and
at least four inches high by one-half inch wide.

(k) Section R322.1. Amend by deleting the sectiats ientirety and adding a
new Section R322.1 to read as follows:

General. Buildings and structures, when permitted to be
constructed in flood hazard areas (including A orzdhes) as
established in Table R301.2(1) shall be designédcanstructed as
required in accordance with the provisions con@inethis section

or by local provisions as applicable.



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017
Page 9 of 18

)] Section R326.1. Amend by deleting Section R3@6t4 éntirety and refer
to Article IX — Swimming Pools of Chapter 5 of @&de Book of the City
of Mesquite, Texas.

4) Chapter 4, Foundations.

(@  Section R401.2.Amend by adding a new second paragraph to Section
R401.2 to read as follows:

Every foundation and/or footing, or any size adufitio an existing
post-tension foundation, regulated by this coddl sfeadesigned
and sealed by a Texas-registered engineer.

(5) Chapter 6, Wall Construction.

(@  Section 602.6.1Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adding a
new Section 602.6.1 to read as follows:

Drilling and notching of top plate.When piping or ductwork is
placed in or partly in an exterior wall or interioad-bearing wall,
necessitating cutting, drilling or notching of ttep plate by more
than 50 percent of its width, a galvanized metalnot less than
0.054-inch thick (1.37 mm) (16 Ga) and five inckiE87 mm) wide
shall be fastened across and to the plate at eédelothe opening
with not less than eight 10d (0.148-inch diameteaving a
minimum length of 1 %2 inches (38 mm) at each sidequivalent.
Fasteners will be offset to prevent splitting af tbp plate material.
The metal tie must extend a minimum of six inchest phe opening.
See Figure R602.6.1.

(b) Figure 602.6.1. Amend by deleting the figure in its entirety andliad a
new Figure 602.6.1 as follows:



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017
Page 10 of 18

WALL CONSTRUCTION

EXTERIOR OR BEARING WALL

16 GAGE (0.054 IN.) AND 5 IN. WIDE
METAL TIE FASTENED ACROSS AND
TO THE PLATE AT EACH SIDE OF THE
NOTCH WITH 8-16d NAILS EACH SIDE

NOTCH GREATER THAN 50
PERCENT OF THE PLATE WIDTH

TOP PLATES
PIPE

For SI: 1inch =254 mm

FIGURE R602.6.1
TOP PLATE FRAMING TO ACCOMMODATE PIPING

(6) Chapter 7, Wall Coverings

(@  Section R703.8.4.1Amend by deleting the last sentence in the sectial
adding the following information to Section R704.8.to read as follows:

In stud framed exterior walls, all ties shall belsored to studs as
follows:

1. When studs are 16 inches (407 mm) o.c., sagdstall be
spaced no further apart than 24 inches (737 mniijcady
starting approximately 12 inches (381 mm) from the
foundation; or

2. When studs are 24 inches (610 mm) o.c, stsdstll be
spaced no further apart than 16 inches (483 mnticaly
starting approximately 8 inches (254 mm) from the
foundation.

(7 Chapter 9, Roof Assemblies.

(@  Section R902.1 Amend by adding a new exception #5 to SectionZR90
to read as follows:

5. Non-classified roof coverings shall be permitted mre-
story detached accessory structures used as tdatarage
sheds, playhouses and similar uses, provided tloe firea



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017

Page 11 of 18

does not exceed 120-square feet. When exceedifg 12
square feet of floor area, buildings of U-occupasanay
use non-rated non-combustible coverings.

(8) Chapter 13, General Mechanical System Requirements.

(@)

(b)

()

Section M1305.1.3Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adding
a new Section M1305.1.3 to read as follows:

Appliances in atticsAttics containing appliances requiring access
shall be provided with an opening and a clear amdbstructed
passageway large enough to allow removal of thgekdrappliance,
but not less than 30 inches (762 mm) high and 2Redgs (559 mm)
wide and not more than 20 feet (6,096 mm) in lemgtbn measured
along the centerline of the passageway from theniogeto the
appliance. The passageway shall have continudigsflemring not
less than 24 inches (610 mm) wide. A level serguace at least 30
inches (762 mm) wide shall be present along sifiéisecappliance
where access is required. The clear access opédmmgnsions shall
be a minimum of 20 inches (508 mm) by 30 incheg (i#tn), or
larger where such dimensions are not large enaughaw removal
of the largest appliance. As a minimum, accedheoattic space
shall be provided by one of the following:

1. A permanent stair.

2. A pull-down stair with a minimum of 300-Ib (136)

capacity.

3. An access door from an upper floor level.

4, An access panel may be used in lieu of items hd23awith
prior approval of the Code Official due to building
conditions.

Exception:The passageway and level service space are not
required where the appliance is capable of beimgicssl
and removed through the required opening.

Section M1305.1.3.1.Amend by adding a sentence at the end of the
paragraph in Section M1305.1.3.1 to read as follows

Low voltage wiring of 50 volts or less shall betaiked in a manner
to prevent physical damage.

Section M1305.1.5Amend by adding a new Section M1305.1.5 to read a
follows:



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017
Page 12 of 18

Attic water heaters. Water heaters are prohibited from being
installed within any attic cavity or space.

(d)  Section M1307.3.1Amend by deleting Section M1307.3.1 in its ertyire
(9) Chapter 20, Boilers/Water Heaters.

(@  Section M2005.2.Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adding
a new Section 2005.2 to read as follows:

Prohibited locations.Fuel-fired water heaters shall notibstalled

in a room used as a storage clos&Vater heaters located in a
bedroom or bathroom shall be installed in a seatsdosure so that
combustion air will not be taken from the livingage. Access to
such enclosure may be from the bedroom or bathreloem through
a solid door, weather-stripped in accordance withexterior door
air leakage requirements of the International Ep&gnservation
Code and equipped with an approved self-closingceev All
combustion air shall be taken from the outdooradcordance with
Section 304.6 of the International Fuel Gas Code.

(10) Chapter 24, Fuel Gas.
(@  Section G2408.3Amend by deleting Section G2408.3 in its entirety

(b)  Section G242.5. Amend by adding a second paragraph to SeG#i2.5
to read as follows:

Both ends of each section of medium pressure gaisgoishall
identify its operating gas pressure with an appdoteg). The tags
are to be composed of aluminum or stainless steketlee following
wording shall be stamped into the tag:

“Warning
1/2 to 5 psi gas pressure
DO NOT REMOVE"

(c) Section G2415.2.2Amend by adding an exception to Section G2415.2.2
to read as follows:

Exception: Corrugated stainless steel tubing (CSST) shall be a
minimum of one-half inch.

(d)  Section G2415.12Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adding
a new Section G2415.12 to read as follows:

Minimum burial depth. Underground piping systems shall be
installed a minimum depth of 18 inches (458 mmphejrade.



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017
Page 13 of 18

(e)  Section G2417.1Amend by deleting the section in its entirety aclding
a new Section G2417.1 to read as follows:

General. Prior to acceptance and initial operation, all pipi
installations shall be inspected and pressureddstdetermine that
the materials, design, fabrication and installafoactices comply
with the requirements of this code. The permideolshall make
the applicable tests prescribed in Sections 2417through

G2417.1.5 to determine compliance with the prowisiof this code.
The permit holder shall give reasonable advanceécexdb the

Building Official when the piping system is ready testing. The
equipment, material, power and labor necessarthiinspections
and test shall be furnished by the permit holddrthe permit holder
shall be responsible for determining that the waitkwithstand the

test pressure prescribed in the following tests.

() Section G2417.4Amend by deleting the section in its entirety aalding
a new Section G2417.4 to read as follows:

Test pressure measuremeritest pressure shall be measured with
a manometer or with a pressure measuring devicigross and
calibrated to read, record or indicate a pressse tlue to leakage
during the pressure test period. The source afspre shall be
isolated before the pressure tests are made. qiieneent used
shall be of an appropriate scale such that pressssecan be easily
determined.

(9) Section G2417.4.1Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adding
a new Section G2417.4t@ read as follows:

Test pressurelhe test pressure to be used shall be not lesslthan
psig (68.9 kPa gaugeThe piping and valves may be tested at a
pressure of at least six inches (152 mm) of merowegsured with

a manometer, slope gauge or spring gauge. For delgeng and
for piping carrying gas at pressures in excessdeinthes water
column pressure (3.48 kPa), the test pressure sbiable less than
60 pounds per square inch (413.4 kPa).

(h)  Section G2417.4.2Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adding
a new Section G2417.4t@ read as follows:

Test duration.Test duration shall be held for a length of time
satisfactory to the Building Official but in no @for less than 15
minutes. For welded piping and for piping carrygas at pressures
in excess of 14-inches water column pressure (BRE, the test
duration shall be held for a length of time satisay to the Building
Official, but in no case for less than 30 minutes.



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017

Page 14 of 18

(i)

()

(k)

()

(m)

Section G2420.1.4Amend by adding a new Section G24201tb.4ead as
follows:

Valves in CSST installationsShutoff valves installed with
corrugated stainless steel (CSST) piping systeral$ Isé supported
with an approved termination fitting, or equivalsopport, suitable
for the size of the valves, of adequate strengith gumality, and
located at intervals so as to prevent or damp xegssive vibration
but in no case greater than 12 inches from theecaitthe valve.
Supports shall be installed so as not to interigith the free

expansion and contraction of the system's pipittg)ds and valves
between anchors. All valves and supports shall ésgded and
installed so they will not be disengaged by movemanthe

supporting piping.

Section 2420.5.1Amend by deleting the section in its entirety addiag
a new Section 2420.5.1 to read as follows:

Located within the same roonThe shutoff valve shall be located
in the same room as the appliance. The shutofbvgtall be within
six feet (1829 mm) of the appliance, and shallnsgailled upstream
of the union, connector or quick disconnect dewicerves. Such
shutoff valves shall be provided with access. Ague shutoff
valves located in the firebox of a fireplace sHadl installed in
accordance with the appliance manufacturer's iodbns. A
secondary shutoff valve must be installed withneéfeet (914 mm)
of the firebox if appliance shutoff is located Iretfirebox.

Section G2421.1Amend by adding a second paragraph and excepion t
Section G2421.10 read as follows:

Access to regulators shall comply with the requeata for access
to appliances as specified in Section M1305.

Exception: A passageway or level service space is not
required when the regulator is capable of beingised and
removed through the required attic opening.

Section G2422.1.2.3mend by deleting Exception 1 and Exception 4 from
Section G2422.1.2.3 in their entirety and renumliee remaining
exceptions appropriately.

Section G2439.7.2Amend by adding a sentence at the end of the pphgr
of Section G2439.7.2 to read as follows:

The size of the duct shall not be reduced alondatsloped length
nor at the point of termination.



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017
Page 15 of 18

(n) Section G2448.1.1Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adding
a new Section G2448.1t@ read as follows:

Installation requirements.The requirements for water heaters
relative to access, sizing, relief valves, draimgpand scald
protection shall be in accordance with the Inteomal Plumbing
Code.

(11) Chapter 26, General Plumbing Requirements.

(@  Section P2603.5.1Amend by deleting the section in its entirety adding
a new Section P2603.5.1 to read as follows:

Sewer depthBuilding sewers shall be a minimum of 12 incH(
mm) below grade.

(12) Chapter 27, Plumbing Fixtures.

(@) Section P2709.2Amend by adding an exception to Section P27@r2ad
as follows:

Exception:Showers designed to comply with ICC/ANSI A117.1.

(b)  Section P2717.2Amend by deleting the last sentence in the sedtiors
entirety and adding a new last sentence in Sed®Pnl7.2 to read as
follows:

Sink and dishwasherThe waste line of a domestic dishwashing
machine discharging into a kitchen sink tailpieballsconnect to a
deck mounted air break.

(13) Chapter 28, Water Heaters.

(@  Section P2801.4. Amend by adding a sentence at the end of Section
P2801.4 to read as follows:

Water heaters are prohibited from being installetthiw any attic
space or cavity.

(b)  Section P2801.6.JAmend by deleting the section in its entirety addiag
a new Section P2801.6.1 to read as follows:

Pan size and drainThe pan shall be not less than 1-1/2 inches (38
mm) in depth and shall be of sufficient size anapshto receive all
dripping or condensate from the tank or water hheake pan shall
be drained by an indirect waste pipe having a diam& not less



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017

Page 16 of 18

than 3/4 inches (19 mm). Piping for safety panndrahall be of
those materials listed in Table 605.4. Multiplenpdrains may
terminate to a single discharge piping system wapgroved by the
administrative authority and permitted by the matdrer's
installation instructions and installed with thasstructions.

(14) Chapter 29, Water Supply and Distribution.

(@)

(b)

(€)

Section P2902.5.3Amend by deleting the first sentence in the secin
its entirety and adding a new first sentence iniBed2902.5.3 to read as
follows:

Minimum standards for landscape irrigation systemsThe

landscape irrigation rules promulgated by the T&@®mission on
Environmental Quality and contained in Title 30, apter 344,
Subchapters E and F, 88344.50-344.65 of the Terasistrative
Code, as the same may be from time to time ameratedhereby
adopted by reference as the landscape irrigaties af the City.

Lawn irrigation systems. The potable water system to lawn
irrigation systems shall be protected against baekfby an
atmospheric-type vacuum breaker, a pressure-typauwa breaker,
a double-check assembly or a reduced-pressureiganzackflow
preventer.

Section P2902.5.3.Amend by adding a new Section P2902.5.3.1 to read
as follows:

Rain and freeze sensors. All new irrigation systems installed
and permitted after the effective date of this wadice shall include
installation of operational rain and freeze sensors

Section P2902.5.3.2Amend by adding a new Section P2902.5.3.2 to read
as follows:

Irrigation backflow testsAll irrigation backflow devices shall be
tested by a currently licensed and registered StditeTexas
Backflow Tester, using currently certified calitedtgauges. The
irrigation backflow device test shall be observedtbe City of
Mesquite Public Works Backflow Inspector duringukeg working
hours determined by departmental policy.

(15) Chapter 30, Sanitary Drainage.

(@)

Section P3005.2.1.Amend by adding a sentence at the end of Section
P3005.2.Jand a second exception to read as follows:



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017

Page 17 of 18

(16)

(17)

Upper terminal. Each horizontal drain shall be provided with a
cleanout at its upper terminal.

Exception 2Cleanouts may be omitted on a horizontal drain
less than five feet (1,524 mm) in length unlesshduee is
serving sinks or urinals.

Chapter 31, Vents.

Section P3103.1Amend by deleting the section in its entirety aclding
a new Section P3103.1 to read as follows:

Roof extensionAll open vent pipes which extend through a roof
shall be terminated at least six inches (152 mnovakthe roof
except that where a roof is to be used for any ggeother than
weather protection, the extensions shall be ruleast seven feet
(2,134 mm) above the roof.

Section P3111Amend by deleting Section P3111 in its entirety.

Section P3112.2Amend by deleting the section in its entirety addiag
a new Section P3112t@ read as follows:

Installation. Traps for island sinks and similar equipment sball

roughed-in above the floor and may be vented bgreihg the vent
as high as possible, but not less than the drardbdegight and then
returning it downward and connecting it to the hontal sink drain

immediately downstream from the vertical fixturaidt The return

vent shall be connected to the horizontal draiough a wye-branch
fitting and shall, in addition, be provided witHaot vent taken off

the vertical fixture vent by means of a wye-bramcimediately

below the floor and extending to the nearest pantiand then

through the roof to the open air or may be conmktdeother vents
at a point not less than six inches (152 mm) alibeeflood level

rim and a minimum slope of one-quarter inch pet {86.9 mm/m)

back to the drain shall be maintained. The rebend used under
the drainboard shall be a one-piece fitting or sseebly of a 45-
degree (0.79 radius), a 90-degree (1.6 radiuspatigtdegree (0.79
radius) elbow in the order named. Pipe sizingldieabhs elsewhere
required in this Code. The island sink drain, tgesh of the return
vent, shall serve no other fixtures. An accessildanout shall be
installed in the vertical portion of the foot vent.

Electrical Chapters 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40421and 43. Amend by deleting
the chapters in their entirety and adding a refewtice to Chapters 33, 34, 35, 36,
37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42 and 43 to read as follows:



Planning & Development/International Residentiad€&doption/April 3, 2017
Page 18 of 18

Refer to the adoptedational Electrical Coddor all references regarding
electrical installations within thieternational Residential Code

SECTION 2. That all ordinances or portions thereabnflict with the provisions
of this ordinance, to the extent of such conflate hereby repealed. To the extent that such
ordinances or portions thereof are not in conflietewith, the same shall remain in full force and
effect.

SECTION 3. That should any word, sentence, clapamgraph or provision of
this ordinance be held to be invalid or unconsonal, the validity of the remaining provisions of
this ordinance shall not be affected and shall nenmafull force and effect.

SECTION 4. That all chapters, sections and sulmsectamended by this
ordinance are intended to amend the specified sworeding chapters, sections and subsections of
theInternational Residential Cod@015 Edition, even though applicable interveranticles and
divisions or similar subparts may not be set ouhis ordinance.

SECTION 5. That any person (as defined in Chapt&ection 1-2 of the Code
of the City of Mesquite, Texas, as amended) viotatany of the provisions or terms of this
ordinance shall be deemed to be guilty of a Claddis@iemeanor and upon conviction thereof,
shall be subject to a fine not to exceed Two Thodsg2,000.00) Dollars for each offense,
provided, however, if the maximum penalty provid@dby this ordinance for an offense is greater
than the maximum penalty provided for the samensteunder the laws of the State of Texas, the
maximum penalty for violation of this ordinance frch offense shall be the maximum penalty
provided by the laws of the State of Texas. Eamhar portion of a day any violation of this
ordinance continues shall constitute a separasnsé.

SECTION 6. That this ordinance shall take effecbad after May 15, 2017.

DULY PASSED AND APPROVED by the City Council of tii&ty of Mesquite, Texas,
on the 3rd day of April, 2017.

Stan Pickett

Mayor
ATTEST: APPROVED:
M
Sonja Land B. J. Smith

City Secretary City Attorney



