
CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

. Annual Uniform Rental Services
Bid Number: 2017-093
Date: July 6, 2017

a. Item b. Description

c. Cost per 
Change       

(Unit Cost)
d. Changes per 

Week

e. Weekly 
Rental Cost per 

Employee      
(c. x d.)

f. Number of 
Employees

g. Total Weekly 
Rental Cost

h. Number of 
Weeks

i. Total One 
Year Cost      
(g. x h. x 1)

Uniform Rental
1 Airport Shirt per bid specifications 0.352               5 1.76 5 8.80 52 457.60
2 Airport Cargo Pants per bid specifications 0.55 5 2.75 5 13.75 52 715.00
3 Animal Control Shirt per bid specifications 0.352 5 1.76 10 17.60 52 915.20
4 Animal Control Cargo Pants per bid specifications 0.55 5 2.75 10 27.50 52 1,430.00
5 Arts Center Shirt per bid specifications 0.352 5 1.76 3 5.28 52 274.56
6 Arts Center Trouser per bid specifications 0.352 5 1.76 3 5.28 52 274.56
7 Executive Shirt per bid specifications 0.44 5 2.20 23 50.60 52 2,631.20
8 Executive Shirt Alternate per bid specifications 0.44 5 2.20 23 50.60 52 2,631.20
9 Executive Trouser per bid specifications 0.44 5 2.20 23 50.60 52 2,631.20

10 Executive Trouser Alternate per bid specifications 0.44 5 2.20 23 50.60 52 2,631.20
11 Industrial Shirt per bid specifications 0.352 5 1.76 228 401.28 52 20,866.56
12 Industrial Shirt Alternate per bid specifications 0.352 5 1.76 6 10.56 52 549.12
13 Industrial Trouser per bid specifications 0.352 5 1.76 228 401.28 52 20,866.56
14 Industrial Trouser Alternate per bid specifications 0.352 5 1.76 10 17.60 52 915.20
15 Parks Services Shorts per bid specifications 0.352 5 1.76 18 31.68 52 1,647.36
16 Utilities Shorts per bid specifications 0.352 5 1.76 8 14.08 52 732.16

Uniform Rental Total $6.38 5 $31.90 626 $1,157.09 52 $60,168.68

c. Cost per 
Change       

(Unit Cost)
d. Changes per 

Week
e. Total Weekly 

Rental Cost
f. Number of 

Weeks

g. Total One 
Year Cost      
(e. x f. x 1)

Mats, Mops and Towels
1 Walk-off mats 3' x 4' 0.95 1 0.950 52 49.40
2 Walk-off mats 3' x 5' 0.95 1 0.950 52 49.40
3 Walk-off mats 4' x 6' 1.50 1 1.500 52 78.00
4 Walk-off mats 3' x 10' 1.90 1 1.900 52 98.80
5 Dust Control Mops 36" size 1.00 1 1.000 52 52.00
6 Dust Control Mops 48" size 1.90 1 1.900 52 98.80
7 Bath Towels 18" x 18" 0.45 1 0.450 52 23.40
8 Bar towels 0.35 1 0.350 52 18.20
9 Fendor Covers 0.16 1 0.160 52 8.32

10 Wipers 0.06 1 0.060 52 3.12

Mats, Mops and Towels Total $9.22 1 $9.22 52 $479.44

Total base bid of all items $60,648.12
Rejected Bid

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:
TERMS:

DELIVERY:
2% 15 Calendar Days

Unifirst Holdings
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

. Annual Uniform Rental Services
Bid Number: 2017-093
Date: July 6, 2017

a. Item b. Description
Uniform Rental

1 Airport Shirt per bid specifications
2 Airport Cargo Pants per bid specifications
3 Animal Control Shirt per bid specifications
4 Animal Control Cargo Pants per bid specifications
5 Arts Center Shirt per bid specifications
6 Arts Center Trouser per bid specifications
7 Executive Shirt per bid specifications
8 Executive Shirt Alternate per bid specifications
9 Executive Trouser per bid specifications

10 Executive Trouser Alternate per bid specifications
11 Industrial Shirt per bid specifications
12 Industrial Shirt Alternate per bid specifications
13 Industrial Trouser per bid specifications
14 Industrial Trouser Alternate per bid specifications
15 Parks Services Shorts per bid specifications
16 Utilities Shorts per bid specifications

Uniform Rental Total 

Mats, Mops and Towels
1 Walk-off mats 3' x 4'
2 Walk-off mats 3' x 5'
3 Walk-off mats 4' x 6'
4 Walk-off mats 3' x 10'
5 Dust Control Mops 36" size
6 Dust Control Mops 48" size
7 Bath Towels 18" x 18"
8 Bar towels
9 Fendor Covers

10 Wipers

Mats, Mops and Towels Total

Total base bid of all items

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:
TERMS:

DELIVERY:

c. Cost per 
Change       

(Unit Cost)
d. Changes per 

Week

e. Weekly 
Rental Cost per 

Employee      
(c. x d.)

f. Number of 
Employees

g. Total Weekly 
Rental Cost

h. Number of 
Weeks

i. Total One 
Year Cost      
(g. x h. x 1)

0.406 5 2.03 5 10.15 52 527.80
0.462 5 2.31 5 11.55 52 600.60
0.406 5 2.03 10 20.30 52 1,055.60
0.462 5 2.31 10 23.10 52 1,201.20
0.512 5 2.56 3 7.68 52 399.36
0.462 5 2.31 3 6.93 52 360.36
0.389 5 1.95 23 44.74 52 2,326.22
0.389 5 1.95 23 44.74 52 2,326.22
0.419 5 2.10 23 48.19 52 2,505.62
0.419 5 2.10 23 48.19 52 2,505.62
0.406 5 2.03 228 462.84 52 24,067.68
0.469 5 2.35 6 14.07 52 731.64
0.34 5 1.72 228 391.02 52 20,333.04
0.48 5 2.40 10 24.00 52 1,248.00
0.58 5 2.90 18 52.20 52 2,714.40
0.58 5 2.90 8 23.20 52 1,206.40

$7.18 5 $35.92 626 $1,232.88 52 $64,109.76

c. Cost per 
Change       

(Unit Cost)
d. Changes per 

Week
e. Total Weekly 

Rental Cost
f. Number of 

Weeks

g. Total One 
Year Cost      
(e. x f. x 1)

2.033 1 2.033 52 105.72
2.033 1 2.033 52 105.72
2.56 1 2.56 52 133.12

3.047 1 3.047 52 158.44
1.296 1 0.984 52 51.17
0.95 1 1.296 52 67.39
0.54 1 0.95 52 49.40

0.153 1 1.10 52 57.200
0.153 1 0.128 52 6.656
0.074 1 0.174 52 9.048

$12.84 1 $14.31 52 $743.86

$64,853.62 
Rejected Bid

Net 30 Days

Cintas Corporation
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

. Annual Uniform Rental Services
Bid Number: 2017-093
Date: July 6, 2017

a. Item b. Description
Uniform Rental

1 Airport Shirt per bid specifications
2 Airport Cargo Pants per bid specifications
3 Animal Control Shirt per bid specifications
4 Animal Control Cargo Pants per bid specifications
5 Arts Center Shirt per bid specifications
6 Arts Center Trouser per bid specifications
7 Executive Shirt per bid specifications
8 Executive Shirt Alternate per bid specifications
9 Executive Trouser per bid specifications

10 Executive Trouser Alternate per bid specifications
11 Industrial Shirt per bid specifications
12 Industrial Shirt Alternate per bid specifications
13 Industrial Trouser per bid specifications
14 Industrial Trouser Alternate per bid specifications
15 Parks Services Shorts per bid specifications
16 Utilities Shorts per bid specifications

Uniform Rental Total 

Mats, Mops and Towels
1 Walk-off mats 3' x 4'
2 Walk-off mats 3' x 5'
3 Walk-off mats 4' x 6'
4 Walk-off mats 3' x 10'
5 Dust Control Mops 36" size
6 Dust Control Mops 48" size
7 Bath Towels 18" x 18"
8 Bar towels
9 Fendor Covers

10 Wipers

Mats, Mops and Towels Total

Total base bid of all items

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:
TERMS:

DELIVERY:

Unit Extended Unit Extended

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Aramark Uniform Nafeco
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