
ITEM NO BID QUANTITIES UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

P1 1 LS MOBILIZATION, BONDING, AND INSURANCE
$419,000.00 $419,000.00 $835,000.00 $835,000.00 $478,000.00 $478,000.00 $463,360.00 $463,360.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00

P2 1 LS TRAFFIC CONTROL $47,964.00 $47,964.00 $126,000.00 $126,000.00 $130,000.00 $130,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $1,008,975.00 $1,008,975.00

P3 20180 CY UNCLASSIFIED ROADWAY EXCAVATION
$26.00 $524,680.00 $11.45 $231,061.00 $25.00 $504,500.00 $13.90 $280,502.00 $32.00 $645,760.00

P4 12140 CY COMPACTED ROADWAY FILL & EMBANKMENT
$13.71 $166,439.40 $6.00 $72,840.00 $20.00 $242,800.00 $5.75 $69,805.00 $10.00 $121,400.00

P5 1740 TON HYDRATED LIME $161.00 $280,140.00 $148.00 $257,520.00 $144.00 $250,560.00 $194.00 $337,560.00 $142.00 $247,080.00

P6 51040 SY 13" CONCRETE PAVEMENT $52.86 $2,697,974.40 $56.60 $2,888,864.00 $55.00 $2,807,200.00 $64.20 $3,276,768.00 $59.00 $3,011,360.00

P7 19130 SY 8" CONCRETE PAVEMENT $40.34 $771,704.20 $41.30 $790,069.00 $36.00 $688,680.00 $63.05 $1,206,146.50 $45.00 $860,850.00

P8 77400 SY 8" LIME TREATED SUBGRADE (44#/SY) $3.15 $243,810.00 $3.25 $251,550.00 $5.00 $387,000.00 $1.25 $96,750.00 $1.50 $116,100.00

P9 800 SY 6" CONCRETE DRIVEWAY $58.98 $47,184.00 $55.00 $44,000.00 $70.00 $56,000.00 $84.00 $67,200.00 $59.00 $47,200.00

P10 50 SY 6" GRAVEL DRIVEWAY $13.45 $672.50 $10.00 $500.00 $40.00 $2,000.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $72.00 $3,600.00

P11 620 SY
6" (2" TYPE D ON 4" TYPE B) ASPHALT PAVEMENT WITH 8" 

FLEXIBLE BASE AT BERRY CULVERTS

$64.66 $40,089.20 $55.00 $34,100.00 $50.00 $31,000.00 $127.00 $78,740.00 $53.00 $32,860.00

P12 1700 SY
2" TYPE D TEMPORARY ASPHALT PAVEMENT WITH 6" 

ASPHALT MILLINGS

$23.79 $40,443.00 $24.00 $40,800.00 $20.00 $34,000.00 $38.00 $64,600.00 $23.00 $39,100.00

P13 290 SY 6" ASPHALT TRANSITION (2" TYPE D ON 4" TYPE B)
$71.30 $20,677.00 $100.00 $29,000.00 $90.00 $26,100.00 $122.00 $35,380.00 $88.00 $25,520.00

P14 10 EA REMOVE AND REINSTALL MAILBOX $304.94 $3,049.40 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $750.00 $7,500.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00

P15 770 LF 6' CHAIN LINK FENCE $23.00 $17,710.00 $25.00 $19,250.00 $20.00 $15,400.00 $23.00 $17,710.00 $21.00 $16,170.00

P16 50 LF 6' CHAIN LINK FENCE WITH BARBED WIRE
$28.75 $1,437.50 $36.00 $1,800.00 $23.00 $1,150.00 $33.00 $1,650.00 $31.00 $1,550.00

P17 1690 LF 5' GALVANIZED BARBED WIRE FENCE WITH METAL POSTS
$9.78 $16,528.20 $6.00 $10,140.00 $6.50 $10,985.00 $6.00 $10,140.00 $4.90 $8,281.00

P18 320 LF 5' GALVANIZED WOVEN WIRE FENCE WITH METAL POSTS
$14.38 $4,601.60 $11.30 $3,616.00 $15.00 $4,800.00 $11.00 $3,520.00 $9.80 $3,136.00

P19 400 LF 5' TUBULAR STEEL FENCE $40.25 $16,100.00 $40.00 $16,000.00 $25.00 $10,000.00 $38.00 $15,200.00 $35.50 $14,200.00

P20 2940 LF GUARDRAIL $28.52 $83,848.80 $23.00 $67,620.00 $20.00 $58,800.00 $22.00 $64,680.00 $20.75 $61,005.00

P21 13 EA GUARDRAIL END TREATMENT $2,742.75 $35,655.75 $3,700.00 $48,100.00 $2,500.00 $32,500.00 $3,550.00 $46,150.00 $3,350.00 $43,550.00

P22 13 EA DOWNSTREAM ANCHOR TERMINAL SECTION
$1,150.00 $14,950.00 $1,320.00 $17,160.00 $1,500.00 $19,500.00 $1,260.00 $16,380.00 $1,200.00 $15,600.00

P23 5 EA
LIGHT FOUNDATION (INCLUDING CONDUIT TO POWER 

SOURCE)

$4,945.00 $24,725.00 $2,350.00 $11,750.00 $2,350.00 $11,750.00 $2,500.00 $12,500.00 $2,350.00 $11,750.00

P24 40 EA INSTALL NEW SIGN ON NEW POST ASSEMBLY
$454.25 $18,170.00 $510.00 $20,400.00 $395.00 $15,800.00 $490.00 $19,600.00 $375.00 $15,000.00

P25 28610 LF TYPE I (125MIL) 4" SOLID LINE - WHITE $0.92 $26,321.20 $1.15 $32,901.50 $0.60 $17,166.00 $1.10 $31,471.00 $0.79 $22,601.90

P26 6240 EA TYPE II-A-A RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS
$4.31 $26,894.40 $4.40 $27,456.00 $3.00 $18,720.00 $4.20 $26,208.00 $3.93 $24,523.20

P27 260 EA TYPE II-C-R RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS
$4.31 $1,120.60 $4.40 $1,144.00 $4.00 $1,040.00 $4.20 $1,092.00 $3.93 $1,021.80

P28 1330 LF TYPE I (125MIL) 8" SOLID LINE - WHITE $1.73 $2,300.90 $2.25 $2,992.50 $1.80 $2,394.00 $2.10 $2,793.00 $1.57 $2,088.10

P29 360 LF TYPE I (125MIL) 24" SOLID LINE - WHITE $9.20 $3,312.00 $6.60 $2,376.00 $6.00 $2,160.00 $6.30 $2,268.00 $8.39 $3,020.40

P30 16 EA WHITE ARROW (125MIL) $201.25 $3,220.00 $165.00 $2,640.00 $110.00 $1,760.00 $160.00 $2,560.00 $183.51 $2,936.16

P31 10 EA WHITE DOUBLE ARROW (125MIL) $391.00 $3,910.00 $220.00 $2,200.00 $215.00 $2,150.00 $210.00 $2,100.00 $356.54 $3,565.40

P32 5 EA WHITE WORD (RR XING)(125MIL) $402.50 $2,012.50 $850.00 $4,250.00 $425.00 $2,125.00 $800.00 $4,000.00 $367.03 $1,835.15

P33 13 EA WHITE WORD (ONLY)(125MIL) $212.75 $2,765.75 $165.00 $2,145.00 $130.00 $1,690.00 $160.00 $2,080.00 $194.00 $2,522.00

P34 20 EA WHITE 12" YIELD MARKER (125MIL) $34.50 $690.00 $33.00 $660.00 $15.00 $300.00 $32.00 $640.00 $31.46 $629.20

P35 2 EA PROJECT SIGN $385.25 $770.50 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $550.00 $1,100.00 $325.00 $650.00

P36 1 EA
RELOCATE EX MESQUITE METRO AIRPORT ENTRANCE 

SIGN ON NEW FOUNDATION

$46,000.00 $46,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00

$5,656,871.80 $5,926,905.00 $5,897,530.00 $6,690,153.50 $6,980,440.31

ITEM NO BID QUANTITIES UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

D1 1 LS CHANNEL GRADING $44,587.59 $44,587.59 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,700.00 $30,700.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

D2 250 LF 10'X10' RCB $524.63 $131,157.50 $809.00 $202,250.00 $1,000.00 $250,000.00 $1,460.00 $365,000.00 $728.00 $182,000.00

D3 300 LF 10'X7' RCB $433.32 $129,996.00 $699.00 $209,700.00 $850.00 $255,000.00 $1,000.00 $300,000.00 $660.00 $198,000.00

D4 370 LF 5'X3' RCB $295.55 $109,353.50 $283.00 $104,710.00 $364.00 $134,680.00 $273.00 $101,010.00 $310.00 $114,700.00

D5 190 LF 5'X2' RCB $261.05 $49,599.50 $259.00 $49,210.00 $260.00 $49,400.00 $252.00 $47,880.00 $260.00 $49,400.00

D6 320 LF 6'X2' RCB (CLASS IV) $342.70 $109,664.00 $285.00 $91,200.00 $333.00 $106,560.00 $237.00 $75,840.00 $304.00 $97,280.00

D7 460 LF 4'X3' RCB $224.25 $103,155.00 $226.00 $103,960.00 $281.00 $129,260.00 $210.00 $96,600.00 $268.00 $123,280.00

D8 70 LF 3'X2' RCB $167.90 $11,753.00 $178.00 $12,460.00 $372.00 $26,040.00 $184.00 $12,880.00 $190.00 $13,300.00

D9 80 LF 24" RCP $81.65 $6,532.00 $89.00 $7,120.00 $102.00 $8,160.00 $116.00 $9,280.00 $145.00 $11,600.00

D10 50 LF 21" RCP $71.30 $3,565.00 $75.00 $3,750.00 $89.00 $4,450.00 $105.00 $5,250.00 $78.00 $3,900.00

D11 250 LF 18" RCP $65.55 $16,387.50 $70.00 $17,500.00 $116.00 $29,000.00 $95.00 $23,750.00 $65.00 $16,250.00

D12 2340 LF STORM DRAIN TRENCH SAFETY $0.58 $1,357.20 $1.00 $2,340.00 $1.00 $2,340.00 $2.00 $4,680.00 $1.00 $2,340.00

D13 1 LF STORM DRAIN TRENCH SAFETY PLAN $759.00 $759.00 $375.00 $375.00 $750.00 $750.00 $525.00 $525.00 $2,600.00 $2,600.00

D14 1 EA CULVERT A1 DOWNSTREAM HEADWALL (4'X3' PW)
$10,177.50 $10,177.50 $5,556.00 $5,556.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,450.00 $9,450.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00

D15 1 EA CULVERT A1 UPSTREAM HEADWALL (4'X3' PW)
$7,015.00 $7,015.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $7,875.00 $7,875.00 $13,000.00 $13,000.00

D16 1 EA CULVERT A2 DOWNSTREAM HEADWALL (3-4'X3' RCB PW)
$22,310.00 $22,310.00 $12,250.00 $12,250.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00 $19,950.00 $19,950.00 $29,000.00 $29,000.00

D17 1 EA CULVERT A2 UPSTREAM HEADWALL (3-4'X3' RCB PW)
$10,465.00 $10,465.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $9,250.00 $9,250.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00

D18 1 EA CULVERT B DOWNSTREAM HEADWALL (2-5'X3' RCB PW)
$16,445.00 $16,445.00 $8,550.00 $8,550.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $14,700.00 $14,700.00 $23,000.00 $23,000.00

D19 1 EA CULVERT B UPSTREAM HEADWALL (2-5'X3' RCB PW)
$9,775.00 $9,775.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $8,250.00 $8,250.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

D20 1 EA CULVERT C DOWNSTREAM HEADWALL (2-4'X3' RCB PW)
$25,012.50 $25,012.50 $13,200.00 $13,200.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $25,200.00 $25,200.00 $33,000.00 $33,000.00

D21 1 EA CULVERT C UPSTREAM HEADWALL (2-4'X3' RCB PW)
$9,775.00 $9,775.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $8,800.00 $8,800.00 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00

D22 1 EA CULVERT D DOWNSTREAM HEADWALL (3-5'X3' RCB PW)
$28,405.00 $28,405.00 $16,350.00 $16,350.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $25,200.00 $25,200.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00

D23 1 EA CULVERT D UPSTREAM HEADWALL (3-5'X3' RCB PW)
$12,075.00 $12,075.00 $5,900.00 $5,900.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $9,450.00 $9,450.00 $17,775.00 $17,775.00

D24 1 EA
CULVERT G2 DOWNSTREAM HEADWALL (2-10'X7' RCB FW-

S)

$30,042.87 $30,042.87 $14,700.00 $14,700.00 $28,000.00 $28,000.00 $26,250.00 $26,250.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00

D25 1 EA CULVERT G2 UPSTREAM HEADWALL (2-10'X7' RCB PW)
$48,581.05 $48,581.05 $28,915.00 $28,915.00 $34,500.00 $34,500.00 $36,750.00 $36,750.00 $47,000.00 $47,000.00

D26 1 EA
CULVERT G3 DOWNSTREAM HEADWALL (3-10'X10' RCB SW-

0)

$28,254.54 $28,254.54 $15,250.00 $15,250.00 $36,000.00 $36,000.00 $31,500.00 $31,500.00 $38,000.00 $38,000.00

D27 1 EA CULVERT G3 UPSTREAM HEADWALL (3-10'X10' RCB PW)
$47,003.07 $47,003.07 $35,250.00 $35,250.00 $49,000.00 $49,000.00 $52,500.00 $52,500.00 $63,000.00 $63,000.00

D28 1 EA SETP-PD (6'X2' RCB (4:1)) $6,095.00 $6,095.00 $3,250.00 $3,250.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $5,250.00 $5,250.00 $7,600.00 $7,600.00

D29 2 EA SETB-PD (1-3'X2' RCB (4:1)) $9,315.00 $18,630.00 $2,575.00 $5,150.00 $8,500.00 $17,000.00 $4,200.00 $8,400.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00

D30 2 EA PSET-RP (2-21" RCP (4:1)) $2,185.00 $4,370.00 $2,900.00 $5,800.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00

D31 1 EA PSET-RP (24" RCP (4:1)) $2,185.00 $2,185.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,050.00 $1,050.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00

D32 2 EA PSET-RP (2-18" RCP (4:1)) $2,185.00 $4,370.00 $2,300.00 $4,600.00 $2,800.00 $5,600.00 $1,890.00 $3,780.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00

D33 12 EA PSET-RP (1-18" RCP (4:1)) $2,185.00 $26,220.00 $2,000.00 $24,000.00 $2,000.00 $24,000.00 $945.00 $11,340.00 $3,100.00 $37,200.00

D34 2 EA CH-FW-30 (1-18" RCP) $2,185.00 $4,370.00 $1,850.00 $3,700.00 $2,400.00 $4,800.00 $3,150.00 $6,300.00 $6,200.00 $12,400.00

D35 2 EA 10' RECESSED INLET $4,140.00 $8,280.00 $3,850.00 $7,700.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $5,250.00 $10,500.00 $8,800.00 $17,600.00

D36 2430 SY 6" CONCRETE-LINED CHANNEL $60.36 $146,674.80 $122.00 $296,460.00 $75.00 $182,250.00 $86.00 $208,980.00 $83.00 $201,690.00

D37 500 SY TYPE R (GROUTED) ROCK RIPRAP $77.56 $38,780.00 $85.00 $42,500.00 $90.00 $45,000.00 $90.00 $45,000.00 $87.00 $43,500.00

D38 2960 SY TURF REINFORCEMENT MAT $5.28 $15,628.80 $2.25 $6,660.00 $7.00 $20,720.00 $5.00 $14,800.00 $8.84 $26,166.40

$1,298,806.92 $1,389,816.00 $1,620,810.00 $1,677,020.00 $1,668,081.40

ITEM NO BID QUANTITIES UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

EC1 1 LS EROSION CONTROL $54,898.70 $54,898.70 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $102,500.00 $102,500.00 $57,013.40 $57,013.40

$54,898.70 $55,000.00 $50,000.00 $102,500.00 $57,013.40

ITEM NO BID QUANTITIES UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

LS1 29,760 SY SEEDING / HYDROMULCH $1.39 $41,366.40 $1.15 $34,224.00 $0.60 $17,856.00 $1.75 $52,080.00 $0.45 $13,392.00

LS2 29,760 SY TOP SOIL $3.44 $102,374.40 $4.00 $119,040.00 $1.00 $29,760.00 $2.00 $59,520.00 $3.00 $89,280.00

$143,740.80 $153,264.00 $47,616.00 $111,600.00 $102,672.00

ITEM NO BID QUANTITIES UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

W1 12,450 LF 12" DIA. C-900 DR-14 PVC WATER LINE (OPEN CUT)
$63.25 $787,462.50 $68.00 $846,600.00 $63.00 $784,350.00 $63.00 $784,350.00 $80.00 $996,000.00

McMahon Contracting Glenn Thurman INC Mario Sinaciola Sons Tiseo Paving Texas Sterling
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Paving Base Bid
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ITEM NO BID QUANTITIES UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

McMahon Contracting Glenn Thurman INC Mario Sinaciola Sons Tiseo Paving Texas Sterling

W2 60 LF 8" DIA. C-900 DR-14 PVC WATER LINE (OPEN CUT)
$57.50 $3,450.00 $75.00 $4,500.00 $350.00 $21,000.00 $53.00 $3,180.00 $464.00 $27,840.00

W3 1 EA 8" RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVE WITH BOX
$2,064.25 $2,064.25 $1,350.00 $1,350.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,575.00 $1,575.00 $4,054.00 $4,054.00

W4 21 EA 12" RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVE WITH BOX
$3,359.15 $70,542.15 $2,400.00 $50,400.00 $2,000.00 $42,000.00 $2,625.00 $55,125.00 $2,930.00 $61,530.00

W5 15 EA FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY $4,962.25 $74,433.75 $4,500.00 $67,500.00 $5,000.00 $75,000.00 $4,200.00 $63,000.00 $5,515.00 $82,725.00

W6 5 EA 1" COMBINATION AIR RELEASE VALVE $4,681.65 $23,408.25 $3,500.00 $17,500.00 $4,500.00 $22,500.00 $4,200.00 $21,000.00 $6,030.00 $30,150.00

W7 2 EA SHORT SIDE WATER SERVICE AND TAP
$1,557.10 $3,114.20 $1,043.00 $2,086.00 $1,650.00 $3,300.00 $2,625.00 $5,250.00 $2,390.00 $4,780.00

W8 5 EA LONG SIDE WATER SERVICE AND TAP $1,863.00 $9,315.00 $1,534.00 $7,670.00 $1,675.00 $8,375.00 $3,675.00 $18,375.00 $2,446.00 $12,230.00

W9 1 EA WATER SAMPLE STATION $3,922.65 $3,922.65 $2,150.00 $2,150.00 $2,375.00 $2,375.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $10,945.00 $10,945.00

W10 4 EA PLUG EXISTING WATER LINE $1,139.65 $4,558.60 $950.00 $3,800.00 $1,250.00 $5,000.00 $790.00 $3,160.00 $1,185.00 $4,740.00

W11 1 EA EXISTING GATE VALVE ABANDONMENT $799.25 $799.25 $200.00 $200.00 $950.00 $950.00 $790.00 $790.00 $3,330.00 $3,330.00

W12 9 EA REMOVAL AND SALVAGE EXISTING FIRE HYDRANT
$1,357.00 $12,213.00 $475.00 $4,275.00 $1,350.00 $12,150.00 $790.00 $7,110.00 $950.00 $8,550.00

W13 2 EA EXISTING WATER LINE LOWERING/RAISING
$4,702.35 $9,404.70 $3,732.00 $7,464.00 $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $5,250.00 $10,500.00 $6,556.00 $13,112.00

W14 15 EA VALVE BOX ADJUSTMENT $472.65 $7,089.75 $150.00 $2,250.00 $550.00 $8,250.00 $370.00 $5,550.00 $925.00 $13,875.00

W15 12,510 LF TRENCH SAFETY $0.58 $7,255.80 $0.85 $10,633.50 $1.00 $12,510.00 $2.00 $25,020.00 $1.00 $12,510.00

W16 1 LS WATER LINE TRENCH SAFETY PLAN $759.00 $759.00 $375.00 $375.00 $500.00 $500.00 $525.00 $525.00 $2,600.00 $2,600.00

W17 80 SY ASPHALT PAVING REPAIR $67.81 $5,424.80 $63.00 $5,040.00 $80.00 $6,400.00 $105.00 $8,400.00 $62.00 $4,960.00

W18 60 SY CONCRETE DRIVEWAY REPAIR $70.74 $4,244.40 $90.00 $5,400.00 $125.00 $7,500.00 $105.00 $6,300.00 $97.00 $5,820.00

$1,029,462.05 $1,039,193.50 $1,043,360.00 $1,023,410.00 $1,299,751.00

ITEM NO BID QUANTITIES UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

SS1 860 LF
8" DIA. ASTM 3034, SDR-26 PVC SANITARY SEWER PIPE 

(OPEN CUT)

$50.60 $43,516.00 $50.00 $43,000.00 $88.00 $75,680.00 $63.00 $54,180.00 $80.00 $68,800.00

SS2 220 LF
8" DIA. ASTM 3034, SDR-26 PVC SANITARY SEWER PIPE (BY 

EARTHEN BORE)

$437.00 $96,140.00 $220.00 $48,400.00 $440.00 $96,800.00 $368.00 $80,960.00 $278.00 $61,160.00

SS3 1 LF SANITARY SEWER LINE TRENCH SAFETY PLAN
$759.00 $759.00 $375.00 $375.00 $500.00 $500.00 $525.00 $525.00 $6,510.00 $6,510.00

SS4 2 EA 4-FOOT DIA. SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE
$7,575.05 $15,150.10 $4,780.00 $9,560.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $4,725.00 $9,450.00 $5,580.00 $11,160.00

SS5 2 EA 5-FOOT DIA. SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE
$13,358.40 $26,716.80 $10,213.00 $20,426.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00 $7,350.00 $14,700.00 $8,610.00 $17,220.00

SS6 1 EA MODIFY EXISTING SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE
$3,259.10 $3,259.10 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,250.00 $3,250.00 $4,725.00 $4,725.00 $1,138.00 $1,138.00

SS7 1 EA REMOVE EXISTING SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE
$2,811.75 $2,811.75 $760.00 $760.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,575.00 $1,575.00 $4,030.00 $4,030.00

SS8 1 EA
CONNECT EXISTING SANITARY SEWER PIPE TO PROPOSED 

MANHOLE

$998.20 $998.20 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $3,150.00 $3,150.00 $5,220.00 $5,220.00

SS9 860 LF SANITARY SEWER LINE TRENCH SAFETY
$1.15 $989.00 $0.85 $731.00 $2.00 $1,720.00 $2.00 $1,720.00 $1.00 $860.00

SS10 2 EA EXPLORATORY EXCAVATION (POT HOLE)
$1,483.50 $2,967.00 $2,300.00 $4,600.00 $1,750.00 $3,500.00 $525.00 $1,050.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00

SS11 40 SY ASPHALT PAVEMENT REPAIR $74.61 $2,984.40 $65.00 $2,600.00 $135.00 $5,400.00 $105.00 $4,200.00 $62.00 $2,480.00

S12 20 LF LINE B- CHAIN LINK FENCE $80.50 $1,610.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $28.75 $575.00 $53.00 $1,060.00 $21.00 $420.00

$197,901.35 $134,452.00 $235,925.00 $177,295.00 $181,398.00

ITEM NO BID QUANTITIES UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE  AMOUNT 

TS1 120 LF CONDUIT (4" TRENCHED)(SCH 40) $18.40 $2,208.00 $10.00 $1,200.00 $10.00 $1,200.00 $10.50 $1,260.00 $10.00 $1,200.00

TS2 370 LF CONDUIT (4" BORED)(SCH 40) $29.90 $11,063.00 $22.00 $8,140.00 $22.00 $8,140.00 $24.00 $8,880.00 $22.00 $8,140.00

TS3 5 EA GROUND BOX (TYPE C-162911) WITH CONCRETE APRON
$1,035.00 $5,175.00 $685.00 $3,425.00 $685.00 $3,425.00 $720.00 $3,600.00 $685.00 $3,425.00

$18,446.00 $12,765.00 $12,765.00 $13,740.00 $12,765.00

ITEM NO BID QUANTITIES UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

TSA1 15 LF TRAFFIC SIGNAL FOUNDATION (TYPE 36-B)
$293.25 $4,398.75 $220.00 $3,300.00 $220.00 $3,300.00 $231.00 $3,465.00 $220.00 $3,300.00

TSA2 66 LF TRAFFIC SIGNAL FOUNDATION (TYPE 48-A)
$327.75 $21,631.50 $365.00 $24,090.00 $365.00 $24,090.00 $384.00 $25,344.00 $365.00 $24,090.00

TSA3 240 LF CONDUIT (2" TRENCHED)(SCH 40) $11.50 $2,760.00 $7.00 $1,680.00 $7.00 $1,680.00 $8.00 $1,920.00 $7.00 $1,680.00

TSA4 20 LF CONDUIT (2" PVC)(SCH 80) RISER $6.90 $138.00 $8.25 $165.00 $8.25 $165.00 $9.00 $180.00 $8.25 $165.00

TSA5 100 LF CONDUIT (3" TRENCHED)(SCH 40) $13.80 $1,380.00 $9.50 $950.00 $9.50 $950.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $9.50 $950.00

TSA6 70 LF CONDUIT (4" TRENCHED)(SCH 40) $16.10 $1,127.00 $10.00 $700.00 $10.00 $700.00 $11.00 $770.00 $10.00 $700.00

TSA7 650 LF ELECTRICAL CONDUCTOR (#6 BARE) $1.15 $747.50 $1.00 $650.00 $1.00 $650.00 $1.15 $747.50 $1.00 $650.00

TSA8 50 LF ELECTRICAL CONDUCTOR (#6 POWER) 
$1.15 $57.50 $1.40 $70.00 $1.40 $70.00 $1.50 $75.00 $1.40 $70.00

TSA9 20 EA ALUMINUM SIGN (TYPE A) POLE OR MAST ARM MOUNTED
$258.75 $5,175.00 $97.00 $1,940.00 $97.00 $1,940.00 $102.00 $2,040.00 $97.00 $1,940.00

TSA10 1 EA
TRAFFIC SIGNAL CONTROLLER CABINET BASE AND 

FOUNDATION

$4,025.00 $4,025.00 $2,250.00 $2,250.00 $2,250.00 $2,250.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $2,250.00 $2,250.00

TSA11 1 EA
TRAFFIC SIGNAL CONTROLLER AND CABINET (PROVIDED 

BY CITY)(INSTALL ONLY)*

$9,200.00 $9,200.00 $5,260.00 $5,260.00 $5,260.00 $5,260.00 $5,600.00 $5,600.00 $5,260.00 $5,260.00

TSA12 10 EA
VEHICLE SIGNAL SECTION (H3 W/ VISORS & 
BACKPLATES)(W/ MOUNTING HARDWARE)

$1,380.00 $13,800.00 $815.00 $8,150.00 $815.00 $8,150.00 $860.00 $8,600.00 $815.00 $8,150.00

TSA13 4 EA
VEHICLE SIGNAL SECTION (H4FYLT W/ VISORS & 

BACKPLATES)(W/ MOUNTING HARDWARE)

$1,610.00 $6,440.00 $975.00 $3,900.00 $975.00 $3,900.00 $1,025.00 $4,100.00 $975.00 $3,900.00

TSA14 1 EA
VEHICLE SIGNAL SECTION (V5RT W/ VISORS & 

BACKPLATES)(W/ MOUNTING HARDWARE)

$2,070.00 $2,070.00 $1,090.00 $1,090.00 $1,090.00 $1,090.00 $1,150.00 $1,150.00 $1,090.00 $1,090.00

TSA15 580 LF
TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE (3 COND 14 AWG)(STREET NAME 

SIGN CABLE)

$1.15 $667.00 $1.20 $696.00 $1.20 $696.00 $1.30 $754.00 $1.20 $696.00

TSA16 940 LF TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE (5 COND 14 AWG)
$2.30 $2,162.00 $1.35 $1,269.00 $1.35 $1,269.00 $1.50 $1,410.00 $1.35 $1,269.00

TSA17 20 LF TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE (7 COND 14 AWG)
$2.30 $46.00 $1.50 $30.00 $1.50 $30.00 $1.60 $32.00 $1.50 $30.00

TSA18 880 LF TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE (20 COND 14 AWG) 
$4.60 $4,048.00 $8.25 $7,260.00 $8.25 $7,260.00 $8.70 $7,656.00 $8.25 $7,260.00

TSA19 1 EA
MAST ARM POLE ASSEMBLIES (2 ARM - 60'-44' & ANCHOR 

BOLTS)

$23,805.00 $23,805.00 $22,700.00 $22,700.00 $22,700.00 $22,700.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $22,700.00 $22,700.00

TSA20 1 EA
MAST ARM POLE ASSEMBLIES (1 ARM - 40' & ANCHOR 

BOLTS)

$8,050.00 $8,050.00 $7,400.00 $7,400.00 $7,400.00 $7,400.00 $7,770.00 $7,770.00 $7,400.00 $7,400.00

TSA21 1 EA
MAST ARM POLE ASSEMBLIES (1 ARM - 55' & ANCHOR 

BOLTS)

$18,572.50 $18,572.50 $19,400.00 $19,400.00 $19,400.00 $19,400.00 $20,370.00 $20,370.00 $19,400.00 $19,400.00

TSA22 1 EA
MAST ARM POLE ASSEMBLIES (1 ARM - 60' & ANCHOR 

BOLTS)

$18,745.00 $18,745.00 $19,960.00 $19,960.00 $19,960.00 $19,960.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $19,960.00 $19,960.00

TSA23 4 EA
LED EDGE LIT STREET NAME SIGN (W/ MOUNTING 

HARDWARE)

$3,680.00 $14,720.00 $4,865.00 $19,460.00 $4,865.00 $19,460.00 $5,125.00 $20,500.00 $4,865.00 $19,460.00

TSA24 4 EA
EMERGENCY VEHICLE PREEMPTION SYSTEM (OPTICOM 

DETECTOR UNIT)

$1,150.00 $4,600.00 $850.00 $3,400.00 $850.00 $3,400.00 $900.00 $3,600.00 $850.00 $3,400.00

TSA25 1 EA
EMERGENCY VEHICLE PREEMPTION SYSTEM (OPTICOM 2-

CH DISCRIMINATOR UNIT)

$4,600.00 $4,600.00 $4,225.00 $4,225.00 $4,225.00 $4,225.00 $4,450.00 $4,450.00 $4,225.00 $4,225.00

TSA26 920 LF
EMERGENCY VEHICLE PREEMPTION SYSTEM (OPTICOM 

MODEL 138 CABLE)

$1.73 $1,591.60 $1.20 $1,104.00 $1.20 $1,104.00 $1.30 $1,196.00 $1.20 $1,104.00

TSA27 1 EA
POWER SERVICE PEDESTAL (MILBANK 120/240 VAC MODEL 

U8567-0-200)

$4,025.00 $4,025.00 $4,900.00 $4,900.00 $4,900.00 $4,900.00 $5,150.00 $5,150.00 $4,900.00 $4,900.00

TSA28 1 EA
VIDEO DETECTOR SYSTEM (AUTOSCOPE RACKVISION 

TERRA PROCESSOR SYSTEM)

$4,893.25 $4,893.25 $4,300.00 $4,300.00 $4,300.00 $4,300.00 $4,550.00 $4,550.00 $4,300.00 $4,300.00

TSA29 4 EA
VIDEO DETECTOR SYSTEM (AUTOSCOPE RACKVISION 

TERRA CAMERA ASSEMBLY)

$6,463.00 $25,852.00 $5,290.00 $21,160.00 $5,290.00 $21,160.00 $5,550.00 $22,200.00 $5,290.00 $21,160.00

$10,302,121.11$9,795,718.50$8,908,006.00$8,711,395.50

ADDITIVE ALTERNATE

Traffic Signal Additive Alternate

TRAFFIC SIGNAL BASE BID SUBTOTAL

Traffic Signal Base Bid

SANITARY SEWER BASE BID SUBTOTAL

Sanitary Sewer Base Bid

WATER BASE BID SUBTOTAL

TOTAL BASE BID (All Items) $8,400,127.62



ITEM NO BID QUANTITIES UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

McMahon Contracting Glenn Thurman INC Mario Sinaciola Sons Tiseo Paving Texas Sterling

TSA30 980 LF
VIDEO DETECTOR SYSTEM (AUTOSCOPE RACKVISION 

TERRA) COM CABLE (COAXIAL AND 3C POWER)

$3.45 $3,381.00 $2.50 $2,450.00 $2.50 $2,450.00 $2.65 $2,597.00 $2.50 $2,450.00

TSA31 1 EA
VARIABLE MESSAGE SIGN (W/ MOUNTING HARDWARE AND 

CABLE)

$6,325.00 $6,325.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,300.00 $6,300.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00

TSA32 1 LS UPRR COORDINATION $3,450.00 $3,450.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $21,500.00 $21,500.00 $3,675.00 $3,675.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00

TSA33 1 LS PTZ CAMERA AND WIRING (INSTALL ONLY)
$862.50 $862.50 $650.00 $650.00 $650.00 $650.00 $690.00 $690.00 $650.00 $650.00

TSA34 1 LS ENCOM RADIO AND WIRING (INSTALL ONLY)
$862.50 $862.50 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $265.00 $265.00 $250.00 $250.00

$224,208.60 $204,309.00 $222,309.00 $215,556.50 $204,309.00

ITEM NO BID QUANTITIES UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

P8 -16,077 SY 8" CONCRETE PAVEMENT (DEDUCT) $40.34 ($648,546.18) $41.30 ($663,980.10) $36.00 ($578,772.00) $63.05 ($1,013,654.85) $45.00 ($723,465.00)

P8A 16,077 SY 2" TYPE D ASPHALT $13.00 $209,001.00 $14.85 $238,743.45 $9.50 $152,731.50 $11.90 $191,316.30 $9.50 $152,731.50 

P8B 16,077 SY 3" TYPE B ASPHALT $15.64 $251,444.28 $19.00 $305,463.00 $13.40 $215,431.80 $16.70 $268,485.90 $14.00 $225,078.00 

($188,100.90) ($119,773.65) ($210,608.70) ($553,852.65) ($345,655.50)

ITEM NO BID QUANTITIES UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

P8 -16,077 SY 8" CONCRETE PAVEMENT (DEDUCT) $40.34 ($648,546.18) $41.30 ($663,980.10) $36.00 ($578,772.00) $63.05 ($1,013,654.85) $45.00 ($723,465.00)

P8C 16,077 SY 13" CONCRETE PAVEMENT (DEDUCT) $52.86 $849,830.22 $55.60 $893,881.20 $55.00 $884,235.00 $63.85 $1,026,516.45 $59.00 $948,543.00 

$201,284.04 $229,901.10 $305,463.00 $12,861.60 $225,078.00 

$9,808,580.10 

$9,457,422.35 

$204,309.00

$10,302,121.11 

$10,506,430.11 

$10,527,199.11 

$10,160,774.61 

$215,556.50

$9,795,718.50 

$10,011,275.00 

$9,241,865.85 $9,956,465.61 

$8,941,296.60 

$8,795,930.85 

$222,309.00

$8,908,006.00 

$9,130,315.00 

$9,213,469.00 

$8,919,706.30 

$204,309.00

$8,711,395.50 

$8,915,704.50 

$8,591,621.85 $8,697,397.30 

BID ALTERNATE

TOTAL TRAFFIC SIGNAL ADDITIVE ALTERNATE SUBTOTAL

TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATE (All Items) $8,212,026.72 

TOTAL ADDITIVE ALTERNATE (All Items) $224,208.60

$8,436,235.32 

TOTAL BASE BID + ADDITIVE ALTERNATE (All Items)

TOTAL BASE BID (All Items)

TOTAL PAVING ALTERNATE SUBTOTAL

TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATE 2 (All Items) $8,601,411.66 

$8,400,127.62 

$8,624,336.22 

TOTAL BASE BID + ADDITIVE ALTERNATE + ALTERNATE 1 (All Items)

BID ALTERNATE 2

TOTAL PAVING ALTERNATE SUBTOTAL

$10,731,508.11 TOTAL BASE BID + ADDITIVE ALTERNATE + ALTERNATE 2 (All Items) $8,825,620.26 $9,145,605.60 $9,435,778.00 $10,024,136.60 


