CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Water Parts
Bid No:  2018-059
Date: March 22,2018
Core & Main dba HD Supply
Waterworks Fortline Jim Cox
Item No. |ltem Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total
1|Group 1 Brass Fittings 1 Lump 105,177.07 105,177.07 111,962.05 111,962.05 No Bid No Bid
2|Group 2 Gate Valves/ Ductile Iron and Accessories 1 Lump No Bid No Bid 83,538.00 83,538.00 No Bid No Bid
3|Group 3 Fire Hydant 1 Lump No Bid No Bid 50,018.00 50,018.00 No Bid No Bid
4|Group 4 Sewer Line Fitting and Other 1 Lump No Bid No Bid 161,126.50 161,126.50 3,640.00 3,640.00
Mininum Dollar Amount Per Order 0 S1 $200
Special Conditions, Terms, Signature Page Yes Yes Yes
Recommended Bid Recommended Bid
GROSS TOTAL: $ 105,177.07 S 294,682.50 S 3,640.00
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: $ 105,177.07 $ 294,682.50 $ 3,640.00
TERMS: |NET 30 NET 30 NET 30
DELIVERY: |7-14 days 2-3 weeks 20 days
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