CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items
Bid Nunber: 2019-019
Date: November 1, 2018
Lot: GROUP 1 Security Safety Sunset Survival & UATLLC VWR Rosen & Rosen | 3AG Procurement | Pyramid School Ferguson R.S. Hughes Mi’z":::;g:::s
First Aid, Inc. International LLC | Industries, Inc. LLc Products Waterworks
Jersey Safety
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
2019-019--01-01  |Side Leather Palm Gloves 600 pair 2.05 1230.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.85 1110.00| 1.79 1074.00 1.95 1170.00 1.62 972.00{ 1.80] 1080.00
2019-019--01-02  |Vinyl Coated Gloves 600 pair 1.25 750.00:! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 1.29 774.00| 1.50 900.00 2.52 1512.00{ 1.22 732.00|
2019-019--01-03  [Large Heavy Weight Cotton/Polly Glove Liner 8400 pair 0.26 2184.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.45] 3780.00| 0.36 3024.00| 0.30! 2520.00f 0.21 1764.00{ 0.30] 2520.00]
2019-019--01-04  |Double Palm Work Glove 360 pair 2.50] 900.00:! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.25] 810.00{ 2.09 752.40| 3.45] 1242.00 2.34] 842.40( 2.29 824.40
2019-019--01-05  |Heavy Duty Side Split Work Glove 120 pair 9.10 1092.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 1.39 166.80 9.65! 1158.00{ 4.34 520.80| 2.23 267.60|
2019-019--01-06  |Brown Jersey Clute Cut Knit Wrist Gloves 300 pair 0.90 270.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.65/ 195.00{ 0.91 273.00| 0.45] 135.00] 0.38 114.00| 0.43 129.00|
2019-019--01-07  |Brown Jersey Clute Cut Knit Wrist Gloves 3000 pair 0.40 1200.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.65/ 1950.00| 0.55 1650.00 0.45] 1350.00[ 0.38 1140.00{ 0.43 1290.00
2019-019--01-08  |Black PVC Gloves 60 pair 1.65 99.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.95 117.00| 1.85 111.00| 1.65 99.00 1.62 97.20[ 1.56 93.60
2019-019--01-09  |Large PVC Gloves 200 pair 2.20] 440.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.35] 470.00[ 2.59 518.00 3.50! 700.00| 3.13 626.00| 2.50 500.00]|
2019-019--01-1C  |Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 120 pair 2.95 354.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.05 486.00| 3.13 375.60 6.50! 780.00 2.73 327.60| 3.02 362.40|
2019-019--01-11  |Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 400 pair 2.95 1180.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 3.13 1252.00 6.50] 2600.00| 2.73 1092.00{ 3.02 1208.00
2019-019--01-12  |Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 1000 pair 2.95 2950.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.05 4050.00( 3.13 3130.00] 6.50! 6500.00| 2.73 2730.00] 3.02 3020.00|
2019-019--01-13  |Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 900 pair 2.95 2655.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.25 3825.00| 3.35 3015.00] 6.50! 5850.00| 2.93 2637.00] 3.23 2907.00|
2019-019--01-14  |Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 200 pair 2.95 590.00:! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.5 900.00{ 3.59 718.00 7.95/ 1590.00 3.46 692.00| 3.44 688.00
2019-019--01-15  |Medium Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 300 box 5.75 1725.00] No Bid No Bid| 16.45 4935.00 No Bid 4.95 1485.00| 3.98 1194.00 6.70] 2010.00] 10.01 3003.00] 5.00 1500.00
2019-019--01-16  |Large Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 300 box 5.75 1725.00] No Bid No Bid| 16.45 4935.00 No Bid 4.95 1485.00| 3.98 1194.00 6.70] 2010.00] 10.01 3003.00] 5.00 1500.00
2019-019--01-17  |Extra Large Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 360 box 5.75 2070.00] No Bid No Bid| 16.45 5922.00| No Bid 4.95 1782.00| 3.98 1432.80 6.70] 2412.00] 10.01 3603.60] 5.00 1800.00
Total Group 1 $21,414.00 No Bid No Bid $15,792.00 No Bid $22,445.00 $20,654.60 $33,026.00 $24,676.60 $20,422.00
Lot: GROUP 2
Maxon Supplies
" Sunset Survival VWR Rosen & Rosen | 3AG Procurement | Pyramid School Ferguson LLC dba New
Security Safety & First Aid, Inc. UATLLC International LLC| Industries, Inc. LLC Y Products Wategrworks R.S. Hughes Jersey Safety
Equipment
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
2019-019--02-01 |PVC Boots 3 pair 12.9 38.55! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.95/ 29.85| 16.98 50.94| 35.30 105.90| 11.35 34.05 12.2 36.57
2019-019--02-02  |PVC Boots 6 pair 12.9 77.10; No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.95/ 59.70| 16.98 101.88| 35.30 211.80| 11.35 68.10 12.2 73.14
2019-019--02-03  |PVC Boots 16 pair 12.9 205.60! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.95/ 159.20| 16.98 271.68| 35.30 564.80| 11.35 181.60| 12.2 195.04
2019-019--02-04  |PVC Boots 20 pair 12.9 257.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.95/ 199.00| 16.98 339.60| 35.30 706.00| 11.35 227.00| 12.2 243.80
2019-019--02-05  |PVC Boots 60 pair 12.9 771.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.95/ 597.00| 16.98 1018.80[ 35.30| 2118.00] 11.35 681.00| 12.2 731.40|
2019-019--02-06  |PVC Boots 70 pair 12.9 899.50! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.95/ 696.50| 16.98 1188.60[ 35.30| 2471.00] 11.35 794.50| 12.2 853.30
2019-019--02-07  |PVC Boots 50 pair 12.9 642.50! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.95/ 497.50( 16.98 849.00[ 35.30] 1765.00[ 11.35 567.50| 12.2 609.50
2019-019--02-08  |PVC Boots 20 pair 12.9 257.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.95/ 199.00| 16.98 339.60| 35.30 706.00| 11.35 227.00] 12.2 243.80
2019-019--02-03  |PVC Boots 10 pair 12.9 128.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.95/ 99.50{ 16.98 169.80| 35.30 353.00] 11.35 113.50| 12.2 121.90
2019-019--02-1C  |PVC Boots 6 pair 12.9 77.10; No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 16.98 101.88| 35.30 211.80| 11.35 68.10 12.2 73.14
2019-019--02-11  |PVC Boots 3 pair 14.00 42.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 18.99 56.97| 35.30 105.90| 21.88 65.64| 12.2 36.57
2019-019--02-12  |Hip Wader Boots 6 pair 42.00 252.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 34.75 208.50( 45.98 275.88| 58.80 352.80| 60.95 365.70| 45.00 270.00|
2019-019--02-13  |Hip Wader Boots 15 pair 42.00 630.00:! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 34.75 521.25| 45.98 689.70| 58.80 882.00 60.95 914.25( 45.00 675.00|
2019-019--02-14  |Hip Wader Boots 30 pair 42.00 1260.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 34.75 1042.50| 45.98 1379.40[ 58.80| 1764.00[ 60.95 1828.50( 45.00 1350.00
2019-019--02-15  |Hip Wader Boots 20 pair 42.00 840.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 34.75 695.00( 45.98 919.60 58.80] 1176.00[ 60.95 1219.00( 45.00 900.00
2019-019--02-16  |Hip Wader Boots 16 pair 42.00 672.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 34.75 556.00| 45.98 735.68| 58.80 940.80[ 60.95 975.20( 45.00 720.00|
2019-019--02-17  |Hip Wader Boots 16 pair 42.00 672.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 34.75 556.00( 45.98 735.68| 58.80 940.80[ 60.95 975.20( 45.00 720.00|
2019-019--02-18  |Hip Wader Boots 6 pair 42.00 252.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 34.75 208.50( 45.98 275.88| 58.80 352.80| 60.95 365.70| 45.00 270.00|
2019-019--02-1  |Hip Wader Boots 3 pair 42.00 126.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 58.80 176.40| No Bid| 45.00 135.00
2019-019--02-20  |Medium Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair 10.3 307.50! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 30.00 900.00{ 14.40 432.00( 16.8 503.70]
2019-019--02-21 |Large Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair 10.3 307.50! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 30.00 900.00{ 14.40 432.00( 16.8 503.70]
2019-019--02-22  |Extra Large Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair 10.3 307.50! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 30.00 900.00{ 14.40 432.00( 16.8 503.70]
Total Group 2 $9,022.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,325.00 $9,500.57| $18,604.80 $10,967.54 $9,769.26|
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items
Bid Nunber: 2019-019
Date: November 1, 2018
Lot: GROUP 3
Maxon Supplies
N Sunset Survival & VWR Rosen & Rosen | 3AG Procurement | Pyramid School Ferguson LLC dba New
Security Safety First Aid, Inc. UATLLC International LLC | Industries, Inc. LLC Products Waterworks R.S. Hughes Jersey Safety
Equipment
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
2019-019--03-01  |Trench Coats - Size Small 4 each 5.20] 20.80: No Bid No Bid No Bid| 17.50 70.00: No Bid| 6.99 27.96 5.45 21.80 5.10] 20.40[ 5.13 20.52
2019-019--03-02  |Trench Coats - Size Medium 12 each 5.20] 62.40! No Bid No Bid No Bid| 17.50 210.00f 4.75 57.00| 6.99 83.88 5.45 65.40 5.10 61.20 5.13 61.56
2019-019--03-03  |Trench Coats - Size Large 100 each 5.20] 520.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid| 17.50 1750.00| 4.75 475.00[ 6.99 699.00| 5.45] 545.00| 5.10 510.00| 5.13 513.00
2019-019--03-04  |Trench Coats - Size X-Large 100 each 5.20] 520.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid| 17.50 1750.00| 4.75 475.00[ 6.99 699.00| 5.45] 545.00| 5.10 510.00| 5.13 513.00
2019-019--03-05  |Trench Coats - Size 2X-Large 100 each 5.20] 520.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid| 21.20 2120.00| 4.75 475.00[ 6.99 699.00 5.45] 545.00| 5.10 510.00| 5.13 513.00|
2019-019--03-06  |Trench Coats - Size 3X-Large 100 each 5.20] 520.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid| 21.20 2120.00| 4.75 475.00[ 6.99 699.00 5.85] 585.00] 5.10 510.00| 5.13 513.00|
2019-019--03-07  |Trench Coats - Size 4X-Large 30 each 5.20] 156.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid| 21.20 636.00] 4.75 142.50| 6.99 209.70 6.15] 184.50 5.39 161.70| 5.13 153.90
2019-019--03-08  |Trench Coats - Size 5X-Large 20 each 5.20] 104.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid| 21.20 424.00| 4.75 95.00{ 6.99 139.80 6.40] 128.00 5.39 107.80| 5.13 102.60|
2019-019--03-09  |Rain Suits - Size Small 4 each 7.95 31.80; No Bid No Bid No Bid| 19.4 77.40 5.25 21.00| 8.98 35.92 6.30] 25.20 6.56 26.24| 7.06 28.24,
2019-019--03-1C  |Rain Suits - Size Medium 12 each 7.95 95.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid| 19.4 232.20! 5.25 63.00| 8.98 107.76 6.30] 75.60 6.56 78.72| 7.06 84.72
2019-019--03-11  |Rain Suits - Size Large 200 each 7.95 1590.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid| 19.4 3870.00| 5.25 1050.00| 8.98 1796.00 6.30] 1260.00 6.56 1312.00{ 7.06 1412.00
2019-019--03-12  |Rain Suits - Size X-Large 100 each 7.95 795.00:! No Bid No Bid No Bid| 19.4 1935.00{ 5.25 525.00( 8.98 898.00 6.30] 630.00| 6.56 656.00| 7.06 706.00|
2019-019--03-13  |Rain Suits - Size 2X-Large 80 each 7.95 636.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid| 23.00 1840.00| 5.25 420.00| 8.98 718.40| 6.30] 504.00| 6.56 524.80| 7.06 564.80
2019-019--03-14  |Rain Suits - Size 3X-Large 80 each 7.95 636.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid| 23.00 1840.00| 5.25 420.00| 8.98 718.40| 6.90! 552.00]| 7.12 569.60| 7.06 564.80
2019-019--03-15  |Rain Suits - Size 4X-Large 20 each 7.95 159.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid| 23.00 460.00 5.25 105.00{ 9.49 189.80 7.15] 143.00| 7.41 148.20| 7.06 141.20]
2019-019--03-16  |Rain Suits - Size 5X-Large 10 each 7.95 79.50! No Bid No Bid No Bid| 23.50 235.00! 5.25 52.50| 9.49 94.90 7.70 77.00 7.98 79.80| 7.06 70.60
Total Group 3 $6,445.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19,569.60 $4,851.00 $7,816.52| $5,886.50| $5,786.46| $5,962.94|
Lot: GROUP 4
Sunset Survival & Rosen & Rosen | 3AG Procurement | Pyramid School Ferguson Maxon Supplies
Security Safety ) . UATLLC [VWR International N R.S. Hughes LLC dba New
First Aid, Inc. Industries, Inc. LLC Products Waterworks
Jersey Safety
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total Price | Total Price Total Price Total Price| Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price[ Total
2019-019--04-01 _ |First Aid Kit 50 each 18.40| 920.00] 29.97| 1498.50| No Bid No Bid| 35.40 1770.00| 14.75 737.50{ 17.79 889.50, No Bid | 19.59 979.50( 28.50 1425.00
2019-019--04-02  |TECNU Poison Oak & Ivy Cleaner 4 oz. 25 each 6.80] 170.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.57 114.25| 3.10 77.50
2019-019--04-03 | TECNU Extreme Cleanser 4 oz. Tube 50 each 14.95 747.50; No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | 12.54 627.00| 6.75 337.50]
2019-019--04-04  |lvy Block - pre contact lotion 4 oz. 60 each 2.95 177.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.90 174.00| 4.20 252.00]|
2019-019--04-05  |Sun-X SPF30 Sunscreen 4 oz. 300 each 5.85 1755.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.16 1548.00{ 5.25 1575.00
2019-019--04-06 _ |Leather Kneepads 10 pair 13.50 135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | 18.29 182.90| 6.50 65.00
2019-019--04-07  |Regular Brim Safety Hat 60 each 5.15 309.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid| 9.85 591.00, 4.45 267.00{ 6.97 418.20 No Bid 8.61 516.60| 5.80 348.00|
2019-019--04-08 _ |Plastic Capped Knee Pads 40 pair 11.50] 460.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.33 133.20| 3.79 151.60|
2019-019--04-08 _ |Ear Plugs 15 box 57.95 869.25/ 119.95| 1799.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid| 42.25 633.75| 16.98, 254.70] No Bid | 83.78 1256.70/ 96.68 1450.20
2019-019--04-10  |Foam Corded Ear Plugs 32 box 15.75 504.00] 39.95| 1278.40| No Bid No Bid No Bid| 42.25 1352.00| 16.95 542.40| No Bid | 16.95 542.40| 15.00, 480.00
2019-019--04-11  |Clear Safety Glasses 200 each 1.30] 260.00; No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.05 210.00{ 1.69 338.00 No Bid 1.16 232.00] 1.25 250.00
2019-019--04-12  |Half Facepiece Respirator 12 each 11.95 143.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | 23.12 277.44)| 24.99 299.88
2019-019--04-13 _ |Ear Muff Hearing Protector 40 each 5.95 238.00; No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.25 170.00 No Bid No Bid 6.12 244.80| 3.70 148.00|
2019-019--04-14  [Organic Vapor / Acid Gas Cartridge 12 pair 18.95 227.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.37 112.44|19.61 235.32
2019-019--04-15  |Tinted Safety Glasses 1000 each 1.30] 1300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 1.79 1790.00 No Bid 1.22 1220.00{ 1.31 1310.00
2019-019--04-16 _ |Full Brim Safety Hat 36 each 7.20] 259.20! No Bid No Bid No Bid| 15.00 540.00; No Bid| 9.98 359.28 No Bid | 15.67 564.12| 8.69 312.84
2019-019--04-17 _ |Respirator Dust Mask 50 box 7.50 375.00] 28.95| 1447.50| No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.25 162.50| 7.98 399.00 No Bid | 12.40] 620.00| 7.50 375.00]
2019-019--04-18  |Gatorade Sport Drink 1800 each 4.85 8730.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.85 6930.00] 3.68 6624.00|
Total Group 4 $17,579.75 $6,023.65 No Bid No Bid $2,901.00 $3,532.75 $4,991.08 No Bid $16,275.35 $15,716.84
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items
Bid Nunber: 2019-019
Date: November 1, 2018
Lot: GROUP 5
Maxon Supplies |
N Sunset Survival & VWR Rosen & Rosen | 3AG Procurement Pyramid School Ferguson LLC dba New
Security Safety First Aid, Inc. UATLLC International LLC | Industries, Inc. LLC Products Waterworks R.S. Hughes Jersey Safety
Eguipment
Item # Item Qty Unit Price]| Total Price | Total Price Total Price Total Price] Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price] Total
2019-019--05-01 |Safety Vest - Size Large 200 each 5.95 1190.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid| 9.65 1930.00 4.25 850.00{ 6.19 1238.00 5.90] 1180.00 6.02 1204.00{ 5.63 1126.00
2019-019--05-02  |Safety Vest - Size X-Large 200 each 5.95 1190.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid| 9.65 1930.00 4.25 850.00{ 6.19 1238.00 5.90] 1180.00 6.02 1204.00{ 5.63 1126.00
2019-019--05-03  |Safety Vest - Size 2X-Large 100 each 5.95 595.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid| 9.65 965.00! 4.25 425.00{ 6.19 619.00| 5.90] 590.00 6.02 602.00| 5.63 563.00|
2019-019--05-04  |Safety Vest - Size 3X-Large 50 each 5.95 297.50; No Bid No Bid No Bid| 9.65 482.50! 4.25 212.50| 6.19 309.50| 5.90] 295.00| 6.02 301.00| 5.63 281.50]
2019-019--05-05  |Safety Vest - Size 4X-Large 25 each 5.95 148.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid| 9.65 241.25] 4.25 106.25| 6.19 154.75 5.90] 147.50 6.02 150.50) 5.63 140.75
2019-019--05-06  |Safety Vest - Size 5X-Large 25 each 5.95 148.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid| 9.65 241.25] 4.25 106.25| 6.19 154.75 5.90] 147.50 6.02 150.50| 5.63 140.75
2019-019--05-07  |Warning Flags 30 each 1.85 55.50; No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.25 37.50; No Bid No Bid 2.54] 76.20[ 2.93 87.90,
2019-019--05-08  |Orange Traffic Cones 400 each 16.50 6600.00 No Bid| 11.39; 4556.00| No Bid No Bid No Bid| 20.98 8392.00| No Bid| 14.57 5828.00] 17.9 7152.00|
2019-019--05-03  |Green Safety Cones 200 each 19 3790.00 No Bid| 11.89; 2378.00| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 20.10 4020.00] 22.4 4486.00|
2019-019--05-1C  |Fluorescent Orange Flagging 400 each 1.60 640.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.45 2580.00| 18.4 7348.00]
2019-019--05-11 _ |Yellow Caution Tape 50 each 5.35 267.50] 6.99 349.50! No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.75 237.50] 3.99 199.50 8.40] 420.00 6.93 346.50| 3.28 164.00
2019-019--05-12  |Safety Grid Fence 12 each 24| 287.40, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 3.89 46.68| 28.70 344.40| 32.37 388.44| 1.91 22.92
Total Group 5 $15,210.40| $349.50 $6,934.00 No Bid $5,790.00 $2,825.00 $12,352.18] $4,304.40 $16,851.14 $22,638.82|
GROSS TOTAL: $69,672.40 $6,373.15 $6,934.00 $15,792.00 $28,260.60 $39,978.75 $55,314.95 $61,821.70 $74,557.09 $74,509.86
LESS DISCOUNT: ($69.34) ($799.58) ($745.57)
NET TOTAL: $69,672.40 $6,373.15 $6,864.66 $15,792.00 $28,260.60 $39,179.18 $55,314.95 $61,821.70 $73,811.52 $74,509.86
TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 1% 10 Calendar Days [Net 30 Net 30 2% 10 Calendar Days|Net 30 Net 30 1% 10 Calendar Days |Net 30
DELIVERY: 3-4 Calendar Days |14 Calendar Days |7 Calendar Days Not stated 7 Calendar Days |7 Calendar Days 10-14 Calendar Days|1-3 Weeks 5-10 Calendar Days  [Not stated
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