Bid Name:
Bid Number:
Date:

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Annual Supply of Duplicating Papers
2019-018
November 8, 2018

Olmsted Kirk
Western BRW Paper Company !

Iltem Number Item Description Qty Unit Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended
2019-018--01-01 8-1/2" x 11" - 20# White Grain Long 16000 ream 2.78 44,480.00 3.35 53,600.00
2019-018--01-02 8-1/2" x 14" - 20# White Grain Long 200 ream 3.94 788.00 4.67 934.00
2019-018--01-03 11"x 17" - 20# White Grain Long 100 ream 6.22 622.00 7.34 734.00
2019-018--01-04 8-1/2" x 11" - 20# Color Grain Long 400 ream 3.88 1,552.00 5.13 2,052.00
2019-018--01-05 8-1/2" x 14" - 20# Color Grain Long 100 ream 5.22 522.00 6.86 686.00
2019-018--01-06 8-1/2" x 11" - Bright Paper 24# or 60# Grain Long 100 ream 6.43 643.00 7.94 794.00
2019-018--01-07 11" x 17" - 244 or 60# Color Grain Long 100 ream 10.60 1,060.00 15.88 1,588.00
2019-018--01-08 8-1/2" x 11" - 20# White Grain Long 3-Hole Punch 500 ream 3.11 1,555.00 3.67 1,835.00
2019-018--01-09 11" x 17" White Opaque Paper 60# 1200 ream 8.28 9,936.00 11.81 14,172.00

Group 1 Total: $61,158.00 $76,395.00
2019-018--02-01 8-1/2" x 11" Two-part 400 ream 7.28 2,912.00 22.85 9,140.00
2019-018--02-02 8-1/2' x 11" Three-part 400 ream 8.19 3,276.00 25.70 10,280.00
2019-018--03-03 8-1/2" x 11" Four-part 100 ream 8.76 876.00 27.46 2,746.00
2019-018--04-04 8-1/2" x 11" Five-part 20 ream 9.06 181.20 28.24 564.80
2019-018--05-05 Fan-a-part-Adhesive 5 quart 34.79 173.95 54.90 274.50

Group 2 Total: $7,419.15 $23,005.30
2019-018--03-01 8-1/2" x 11" - 67# White Vellum Bristol 100 ream 4.20 420.00 4.82 482.00
2019-018--03-02 8-1/2" x 11" - 67# Various Colors Vellum Bristol 100 ream 4.41 441.00 5.23 523.00
2019-018--03-03 90# White Index 100 ream 4.7699 476.99 5.42 542.00
2019-018--03-04 90# Various Colors Index 80 ream 5.00 400.00 5.88 470.40
2019-018--03-05 110# White Index 100 ream 5.68 568.00 6.46 646.00
2019-018--03-06 #65 Bright Colors 60 ream 6.50 390.00 7.85 471.00

Group 3 Total: $2,695.99 $3,134.40
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2019-018--04-01 8-1/2" x 11" .022 Caliper Chipboard 20 carton 14.69 293.80 40.00 800.00
2019-018--04-02 8-1/2" x 14" .022 Caliper Chipboard 6 carton 14.69 88.14 40.00 240.00
Group 4 Total: $381.94 $1,040.00
2019-018-05-01 8-1/2" x 11" Pressure Sensitive Paper 40 ream 70.25 2,810.00 10.20 408.00
Group 5 Total: $2,810.00 $408.00
2019-018--06-01 8-1/2" x 11" Color Copy Paper 400 ream 7.67 3,068.00 8.78 3,512.00
2019-018--06-02 8-1/2" x 14" Color Copy Paper 60 ream 10.15 609.00 9.14 548.40
2019-018--06-03 11" x 17" Color Copy Paper 25 ream 15.94 398.50 18.28 457.00
2019-018--06-04 11" x 17" Digital Printing Paper, Smooth Finish 1600 ream 10.40 16,640.00 18.17 29,072.00
2019-018--06-05 11" x 17" Digital Printing Paper, Smooth Finish 50 ream 27.13 1,356.50 No Bid
2019-018--06-06 11" x 17" Digital Printing Paper, Smooth Finish 100 ream 14.06 1,406.00 No Bid
2019-018--06-07 11" x 17" Digital Printing Paper, Smooth Finish 50 ream 6.85 342.50 No Bid
Group 6 Total: $23,820.50 $33,589.40

2019-018-07-01 8-1/2" x 11" - #24 White Smooth Finish 150 ream 11.94 1,791.00 No Bid
2019-018-07-02 8-1/2" x 11" - 80# Cover White Smooth Finish 100 ream 29.10 2,910.00 13.52 1,352.00
2019-018-07-03 Royal Fiber - White (no substitutes) Envelopes 25000 each 0.06 1,500.00 28.74 718,500.00
Group 7 Total: $6,201.00 719,852.00

RECOMMENDED BID
GROSS TOTAL: $104,486.58 $857,424.10
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: $104,486.58 $857,424.10
TERMS:|Net 30 Net 30
DELIVERY:|Next Day 2-5 Calendar Days
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