
CITY OF MESQUITE

BID TABULATION

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Concrete

Bid Number: 2019-101

Date: July 30, 2019

1
2500 PSI CONCRETE, CITY TO PICKUP, ALL 

ORDER SIZES 100       CY
 No Bid  $            110.00  $        11,000.00 

2
2500 PSI CONCRETE, DELIVERED BY 

SUPPLIER, ALL ORDER SIZES 100       CY
 $           132.00  $           13,200.00  $            135.00  $        13,500.00 

3
4000 PSI CONCRETE, CITY TO PICKUP, ALL 

ORDER SIZES 1,500    CY
 No Bid  $            120.00  $      180,000.00 

4
4000 PSI CONCRETE, DELIVERED BY 

SUPPLIER, LESS THAN 5 CUBIC YARDS 1,500    CY
 $           145.00  $         217,500.00  $            145.00  $      217,500.00 

5
4000 PSI CONCRETE, DELIVERED BY 

SUPPLIER, 5 CUBIC YARD OR MORE 1,500    CY
 $           139.50  $         209,250.00  $            140.00  $      210,000.00 

6
4000 PSI CONCRETE, RAPID SET, CITY TO 

PICKUP, ALL ORDER SIZES 100       CY
 No Bid  $            300.00  $        30,000.00 

7
4000 PSI CONCRETE, RAPID SET, DELIVERED 

BY SUPPLIER, LESS THAN 5 CUBIC YARDS 100       CY
 $           460.00  $           46,000.00  $            325.00  $        32,500.00 

8 4000 PSI CONCRETE, RAPID SET, DELIVERED 

BY SUPPLIER, 5 CUBIC YARD OR MORE 100       CY
 $           460.00  $           46,000.00  $            330.00  $        33,000.00 

9
FLOWABLE FILL, CITY TO PICKUP, ALL ORDER 

SIZES 100       CY
 No Bid  $              95.00  $          9,500.00 

10
FLOWABLE FILL, DELIVERED BY SUPPLIER, 

LESS THAN 5 CUBIC YARDS 100       CY
 $           116.00  $           11,600.00  $            120.00  $        12,000.00 

11
FLOWABLE FILL, DELIVERED BY SUPPLIER, 5 

CUBIC YARD OR MORE 100       CY
 $           112.00  $           11,200.00  $            115.00  $        11,500.00 

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:

Gibson Mobil Concrete, LLC B&B Ready Mix, Inc

Unit Price Total

554,750.00$                                      760,500.00$                                    

Item No. Unit Price TotalQuantity Unit

554,750.00$                                      760,500.00$                                    

REJECTION REJECTION

Net 30 Net 30
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