Bid Name:
Bid Number:
Lot: Group |
Date:

Annual Supply of Ammunition
2018-007

Target Load Ammunition
October 12, 2017

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Proforce Law

Zero Ammunition Co.,

Baileys House of
Guns/Baileys

Enforcement Inc. Firearms Country
Item Number Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total
2018-007--01-01 9mm 147 Grain FMJ Bullet 110]|thousand 183.78 | 20,215.80 254.00 | 27,940.00 188.90 | 20,779.00
2018-007--01-02 10mm 175-180 Grain FMJ Bullet 5|thousand 282.16 1,410.80 No Bid 229.00 1,145.00
2018-007--01-03 .40 S&W 155-180 Grain FMJ Bullet 60|thousand 175.14 | 10,508.40 298.00 | 17,880.00 190.59 | 11,435.40
2018-007--01-04 .45 ACP 230 Grain FMJ Bullet 30|thousand 205.41 6,162.30 311.00 9,330.00 223.53 6,705.90
2018-007--01-05 .223 55-Grain FMJ Bullet 60|thousand 270.27 | 16,216.20 No Bid 263.16 | 15,789.60
2018-007--01-06 Simmunition - 9mm Grain - Red 10(|thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--01-07 Simmunition - 9mm Grain - Blue 10(|thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--01-08 Simmunition - 9mm Grain - Yellow 4[thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--01-09 Simmunition - 9mm Grain - Green 4[thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--01-10 9mm 100 Grain RHT 1|thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--01-11 .40 S&W 125 Grain RHT 1|thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--01-12 .45 ACP 155 Grain RHT 1|thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--01-13 .223 Rem 42 Grain RHT 1|thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group 1 - Target Load Ammunition - Total 53,102.70 55,150.00 55,854.90

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT: Recommended Bid

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:
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Bid Name:
Bid Number:
Lot: Group Il
Date:

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Annual Supply of Ammunition
2018-007

Duty Load Ammunition
October 12, 2017

Proforce Law

Zero Ammunition Co.,

Baileys House of
Guns/Baileys

Enforcement Inc. Firearms Country
Item Number Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total
2018-007--02-01 Hornady Critical Duty 9mm 135gr Item No. 90235 ONLY 20|thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--02-02 10mm 175 Grain Hollow Point Bullet Winchester ONLY 1{thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--02-03 Hornady Critical Duty .40 S&W 175gr Item No. 91375 ONLY 20|thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--02-04 Hornady Critical Duty .45 Auto+P 220gr. Item No. 90925 ONLY 5|thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--02-05 Hornady Tap Barrier .223 Rem. 62gr. Item No. 83285 ONLY 40|thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--02-06 Federal Item No.LE132 12 gauge 00 Buck ONLY 2|thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--02-07 Twelve (12) Gauge Slug-Sabot Winchester RA12RS15 ONLY 1|thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--02-08 Hornady A-MAX Tap Precision 168gr. Item No. 80965 ONLY 8[thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--02-09 Hornady ELD Match Tap Precision 168gr. Item No. 80725 ONLY 8[thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018-007--02-10 Hornady Tap Urban 110gr. Item No. 80896 ONLY 5|thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group Il - Duty Load Ammuntion - Total No Bid No Bid No Bid

GROSS TOTAL: $53,102.70 $55,150.00 $55,854.90

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL: $53,102.70 $55,150.00 $55,854.90

TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

DELIVERY: 90 - 120 Calendar Days |30 Calendar Days Varies by Product
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Bid Name:
Bid Number:
Lot: Group |
Date:

Annual Supply of Ammunition
2018-007

Target Load Ammunition
October 12, 2017

CITY OF MESQUITE

BID TABULATION

Precision Delta Corp

GT Distributors Inc.

Item Number Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Price Total
2018-007--01-01 9mm 147 Grain FMJ Bullet 110|thousand 203.00 | 22,330.00 215.94 23,753.40
2018-007--01-02 10mm 175-180 Grain FMJ Bullet 5[thousand 553.00 2,765.00 481.36 2,406.80
2018-007--01-03 .40 S&W 155-180 Grain FMJ Bullet 60|thousand 203.00 [ 12,180.00 293.00 17,580.00
2018-007--01-04 .45 ACP 230 Grain FMJ Bullet 30|thousand 248.00 7,440.00 341.07 10,232.10
2018-007--01-05 .223 55-Grain FMJ Bullet 60|thousand 299.50 | 17,970.00 315.22 18,913.20
2018-007--01-06 Simmunition - 9mm Grain - Red 10|thousand No Bid 476.20 4,762.00
2018-007--01-07 Simmunition - 9mm Grain - Blue 10|thousand No Bid 476.20 4,762.00
2018-007--01-08 Simmunition - 9mm Grain - Yellow 4|thousand No Bid 476.20 1,904.80
2018-007--01-09 Simmunition - 9mm Grain - Green 4|thousand No Bid 476.20 1,904.80
2018-007--01-10 9mm 100 Grain RHT 1|thousand 351.00 351.00 408.17 408.17
2018-007--01-11 .40 S&W 125 Grain RHT 1|thousand 427.00 427.00 413.94 413.94
2018-007--01-12 .45 ACP 155 Grain RHT 1|thousand 503.00 503.00 549.89 549.89
2018-007--01-13 .223 Rem 42 Grain RHT 1|thousand 814.00 814.00 793.80 793.80
Group 1 - Target Load Ammunition - Total 1,165.00 88,384.90

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT: Recommended Bid

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:
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CITY OF MESQUITE

BID TABULATION
Bid Name: Annual Supply of Ammunition
Bid Number: 2018-007
Lot: Group Il Duty Load Ammunition
Date: October 12, 2017
Precision Delta Corp GT Distributors Inc.
Item Number Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Price Total
2018-007--02-01 Hornady Critical Duty 9mm 135gr Item No. 90235 ONLY 20|thousand No Bid 471.55 9,431.00
2018-007--02-02 10mm 175 Grain Hollow Point Bullet Winchester ONLY 1|thousand 553.00 553.00 No Bid
2018-007--02-03 Hornady Critical Duty .40 S&W 175gr Item No. 91375 ONLY 20|thousand No Bid 471.55 9,431.00
2018-007--02-04 Hornady Critical Duty .45 Auto+P 220gr. Item No. 90925 ONLY 5|thousand No Bid 541.98 2,709.90
2018-007--02-05 Hornady Tap Barrier .223 Rem. 62gr. Item No. 83285 ONLY 40|thousand No Bid 677.22 27,088.80
2018-007--02-06 Federal Item No.LE132 12 gauge 00 Buck ONLY 2[thousand No Bid 532.36 1,064.72
2018-007--02-07 Twelve (12) Gauge Slug-Sabot Winchester RA12RS15 ONLY 1|thousand 493.00 493.00 No Bid
2018-007--02-08 Hornady A-MAX Tap Precision 168gr. tem No. 80965 ONLY 8[thousand No Bid | 1,068.33 8,546.64
2018-007--02-09 Hornady ELD Match Tap Precision 168gr. Item No. 80725 ONLY 8[thousand No Bid | 1,068.33 8,546.64
2018-007--02-10 Hornady Tap Urban 110gr. Item No. 80896 ONLY 5[thousand No Bid | 1,068.33 5,341.65
Group Il - Duty Load Ammuntion - Total 1,046.00 58,272.06
Recommended Bid

GROSS TOTAL: $ 2,211.00 $146,656.96

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL: $ 2,211.00 $146,656.96

TERMS: Net 30 Net 30

DELIVERY: 15 - 365 Calendar Days |90 Calendar Days
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