Responses

Success: All data is valid!

					Numeric	
Status	Bid/No Bid Decision	#	Rate Schedules	Quantity Required	Hourly Rate	Total Cos
ormal Hourly Labor F	Rates					
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-1	Designated Supervisor	1	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-2	Superintendent	1	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-3	Senior OSP Technician/Special Eqpt. Operator	1	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-4	Foreman	1	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-5	Fiber Splicing (Per Splice or Hour)	1	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-6	Laborer & Driver	1	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-7	Fiber Cable Observer/Guard	1	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-8	Small Emergency Restoration Crew	1	\$ 160.00	\$ 160.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-9	Typical U/G Emergency Restoration Crew	1	\$ 190.00	\$ 190.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-10	Locate person, truck and locate equipment	1	\$ 80.00	\$ 80.00

After Hours/Emergency Labor Rates

Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-1	Designated Supervisor	1	\$ 97.50	\$ 97.50
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-2	Superintendent	1	\$ 97.50	\$ 97.50
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-3	Senior OSP Technician/Special Eqpt. Operator	1	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-4	Foreman	1	\$ 79.50	\$ 79.50
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-5	Fiber Splicing (Per Splice or Hour)	1	\$ 245.00	\$ 245.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-6	Laborer & Driver	1	\$ 52.50	\$ 52.50
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-7	Fiber Cable Observer/Guard	1	\$ 52.50	\$ 52.50
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-8	Small Emergency Restoration Crew	1	\$ 240.00	\$ 240.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-9	Typical U/G Emergency Restoration Crew	1	\$ 285.00	\$ 285.00
uccess: All values provided	Bid	#2-10	Locate person, truck and locate equipment	1	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00

Responses

Success: All data is valid!

TO PERMIT	Bid/No Bid	/A: 41			Numeric	
Status	Decision	#	Equipment Description	Quantity Required	Hourly Rate	Total Cos
ormal Hourly Rates						
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-1	Truck – Splicing	1	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-2	Truck - 1 Ton	1	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-3	Backhoe – Rubber Tired	1	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-4	Truck - 2 Ton	1	\$ 45.00	\$ 45.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-5	Bucket Truck capable of reaching highest point	1.	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-6	Trenching Machine	1	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-7	Water Pumping Service	1	\$ 160.00	\$ 160.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-8	Air compressor with Tools	1	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-9	Emergency Generator Storage and Deployment Service	1	\$ 165.00	\$ 165.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-10	Light Set (Mercury Vapor Unit)	1	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00

After Hours/Emergency Rates

Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-1	Truck – Splicing	1	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-2	Truck - 1 Ton	1	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-3	Truck - 2 Ton	1	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-4	Backhoe – Rubber Tired	1	\$ 45.00	\$ 45.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-5	Bucket Truck capable of reaching highest point	1	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-6	Trenching Machine	1	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-7	Water Pumping Service	1	\$ 200.00	\$ 200.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-8	Air compressor with Tools	1	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#2-9	Emergency Generator Storage and Deployment Service	1	\$ 200.00	\$ 200.00
uccess: All values provided	Bid	#2-10	Light Set (Mercury Vapor Unit)	1	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00

Primary Responses

Success: All data is valid!

					Numeric	
Status	Bid/No Bid Decision	#	Description	Quantity Required	Unit Price	Total Cost
ctual Cost						

Primary Responses

Success: All data is valid!

					Numeric	
Status	Bid/No Bid Decision	#	Description	Quantity Required	Unit Price	Total Cost
6 Above Actual Cost						
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-1	Mark-Up on DIGTESS Invoices	1	\$ 0.15	\$ 0.15
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-2	Mark-Up on Materials Supplied by Contractor	1	\$ 0.15	\$ 0.15

Primary Responses

Success: All data is valid!

Marine Buy and Wall	D		I SAME STATE OF THE SAME STATE			150000000000000000000000000000000000000	Numeric	
Status	Bid/No Bid Decision	#	Description	Item	Measurement		Unit Price	Total Co
Init Pricing								
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-1	Place MISD or City of Mesquite 1.5" HDPE DUCT	Α	LF	1	\$ 10.50	\$ 10.50
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-2	Place MISD 1.5" HDPE DUCT — Shared Labor Cost	В	LF	1	\$ 7.00	\$ 7.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-3	Place City of Mesquite 1.5" HDPE DUCT – Shared Labor Cost	С	LF	1	\$ 7.00	\$ 7.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-4	Place 2" HDPE DUCT	D	LF	1	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-5	Directional Bore 1 – 4" HDPE at Highway Crossing	E	LF	1	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.0
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-6	Directional Bore 1 – 6" HDPE at Railroad Crossing	F	LF	1	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.0
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-7	Install Old Castle or approved equivalent 28" x 48" Concrete MH-MISD	G	EA	1	\$ 2,350.00	\$ 2,350.
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-8	Install Old Castle or approved equivalent 30" x 48" x 36" Quazite HH-Mesquite	н	EA	1	\$ 1,395.00	\$ 1,395.
Buccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-9	Install Old Castle or approved equivalent 4' x 4' x 4' Concrete Manhole	1	EA	1	\$ 4,550.00	\$ 4,550
iuccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-10	Install Groundbox TXDOT Type A	J	EA	1	\$ 1,395.00	\$ 1,395
success: All values provided	Bid	#1-11	Furnish and Install Draka or approved equivalent 144F Smode Cable – MISD	к	LF	1	\$ 4.25	\$ 4.25
Buccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-12	Furnish and Install Corning or approved equivalent 72F Cable – City of Mesquite	L	LF	1	\$ 3.15	\$ 3.15
luccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-13	Furnish and Install Corning or approved equivalent 48F Cable – Traffic	М	LF	1	\$ 2.85	\$ 2.85
uccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-14	Furnish and Install Corning or approved equivalent 12F Cable – City of Mesquite	N	LF	1	\$ 2.15	\$ 2.15
luccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-15	Furnish and Install Draka or approved equivalent 12F Smode Cable – MISD	o	LF	1	\$ 2.15	\$ 2.15
uccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-16	Building Entry – Tunnel under beam into crawl space	Р	EA	1	\$ 700.00	\$ 700.0
uccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-17	Install 1.5" EMT Conduit and Boxes	Q	LF	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00
uccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-18	Install 1.25" Plenum Rated Innerduct in Building	R	LF	1	\$ 9.50	\$ 9.50
uccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-19	Support 2 – 1.5" Ducts on Bline Support in crawl space	s	LF	1	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00
uccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-20	Building Core Entry Core 2 – 2" in Concrete Floor	т	EA	1	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.0
uccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-21	Install 12F Rack Mount Termination Panel – MISD	U	EA	1	\$ 695.00	\$ 695.0
uccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-22	Install 144F Rack Mount Termination Panel – MISD	v	EA	1	\$ 4,250.00	\$ 4,250.0

Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-23	Prep 12F Cable for Splicing at Panel – MISD	w	EA	1	\$ 160.00	\$ 160.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-24	Prep 144F Cable for Splicing at Panel – MISD	x	EA	1	\$ 375.00	\$ 375.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-25	Terminate and Test Fiber at Panel – per fiber – MISD	Υ	EA	1	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-26	Furnish and Install OSP Splice Closure – MISD	z	EA	1	\$ 1,025.00	\$ 1,025.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-27	Fusion Splice and Test FOC – per fiber – MISD	AA	EA	1	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00
Success: All values provided	Bid	#1-28	Curb Route Markers, 3" x 3"	AB	EA	1	\$ 30.00	\$ 30.00
Buccess: All values provided	Bid	#1-29	Cable Route Markers, 3" x 6'	AC	EA	1	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00