
CITY OF MESQUITE

BID TABULATION

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Vehicle and Equipment Batteries

Bid #2020-082 2020-082

Date: June 25, 2020

Item Number Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

Group 1 - Automotive Truck and Industrial Batteries

2020-082--01-01 Battery Type-58R 10 each 50.09 500.90 47.79 477.90 52.95 529.50 93.57 935.70

2020-082--01-02 Battery Type Gel Cell-SLA12350 20 each 53.15 1063.00 42.16 843.20 66.25 1325.00 No Bid No Bid

2020-082--01-03 Battery Optima-D31T 16 each 243.62 3897.92 229.49 3671.84 163.21 2611.36 210.06 3360.96

2020-082--01-04 Battery Type-34/78 50 each 235.37 11768.50 60.55 3027.50 69.21 3460.50 109.30 5465.00

2020-082--01-05 Battery Type-56CS 5 each 60.25 301.25 68.02 340.10 56.76 283.80 92.96 464.80

2020-082--01-06 Battery XHD31C Stud Post 200 each 92.87 18574.00 59.95 11990.00 71.50 14300.00 107.75 21550.00

2020-082--01-07 Battery Type-4DLT 6 each 115.82 694.92 100.18 601.08 117.18 703.08 148.06 888.36

2020-082--01-08 Battery Type-75 10 each 54.12 541.20 50.68 506.80 54.46 544.60 86.49 864.90

2020-082--01-09 Battery Type-8D 6 each 165.32 991.92 111.50 669.00 136.01 816.06 199.33 1195.98

2020-082--01-10 Battery Type-U1L 10 each 28.50 285.00 26.95 269.50 34.97 349.70 45.35 453.50

2020-082--01-11 Battery Type-TM27 30 each 76.72 2301.60 64.95 1948.50 78.50 2355.00 85.13 2553.90

2020-082--01-12 Battery Type-TM24 20 each 64.18 1283.60 52.02 1040.40 69.19 1383.80 80.50 1610.00

2020-082--01-13 Battery Type-26-60 6 each 46.06 276.36 45.00 270.00 49.16 294.96 87.62 525.72

2020-082--01-14 Battery Type-4D 4 each 140.56 562.24 104.10 416.40 128.44 513.76 167.70 670.80

2020-082--01-15 Battery Group 49 10 each 96.19 961.90 72.45 724.50 85.59 855.90 114.78 1147.80

2020-082--01-16 Battery Type-65 50 each 62.58 3129.00 59.00 2950.00 58.15 2907.50 100.09 5004.50

2020-082--01-17 Battery Type-26R 12 each 44.51 534.12 45.00 540.00 49.16 589.92 89.65 1075.80

2020-082--01-18 Battery Type / Group H8-AGM 150 each No Bid No Bid 109.95 16492.50 139.92 20988.00 147.51 22126.50

2020-082--01-19 Battery Type 4D-MT 4 each No Bid No Bid 220.00 880.00 201.00 804.00 No Bid No Bid

2020-082--01-20 Battery Type / Group 47 36 each 48.90 1760.40 56.90 2048.40 62.36 2244.96 106.49 3833.64

2020-082--01-21 Battery Type / Group 34CS 24 each 60.20 1444.80 54.02 1296.48 52.06 1249.44 92.75 2226.00

2020-082--01-22 Battery Type / Group 65-AGM 50 each 55.20 2760.00 115.27 5763.50 134.41 6720.50 149.12 7456.00

2020-082--01-23 Battery Type / Group H6-AGM 60 each No bid No Bid 110.24 6614.40 125.78 7546.80 147.51 8850.60

Total Group 1 53,632.63$      63,382.00$       73,378.14$        92,260.46$          

Item Number Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

Group 2 - Discount

2020-082--02-01 Percentage discount 1 Percentage Off 15% 15% 20% 20% 72% 72% 41% 41%

Item Number Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

Group 3 - Used Battery Credit

2020-082--03-01 Used Battery Core Credit 1 each 18.00 18.00 0.00 0.00 22.00 22.00

GROSS TOTAL:                        53,632.63$      63,382.00$       73,378.14$        92,260.46$          

LESS DISCOUNT:                              (1,845.21)

NET TOTAL:                              53,632.63$      63,382.00$       73,378.14$        90,415.25$          

TERMS: Net 30                                                   Net 30               Net 30                  2% 10 Calendar Days

DELIVERY: 1 Calendar Day 2 Calendar Day 1 Calendar Day 1-2 Calendar Days

Recommended Bid

Alt 3 - $9.00 - Lawn & 

Garden Core Value

O'Reilly Auto Parts
Interamerican Motor LLC

Battery Systems Continental Battery

First Offer - $29.00 - Group 

31 Core Value

Alt 1 - $19.00 - Automotive 

Core Value

Alt 2 - $57.00 - Heavy 

Commercial Core Value

Page 1 of 1


